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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 September 2015 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 92373 LIBERTY SORTS Lewis PC 4435 $1,403,585.37 $1,765,889.15 $398.17 26% 2.85 See Sort Sales Results 
 92038 * WINCH VRH &  Mason SP 3462 $805,000.00 $1,640,223.20 $473.78 104% 3.00 Murphy Company 
 VDT 
 91813 SQUIRT Thurston SP 4304 $985,000.00 $1,283,596.58 $298.23 30% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

September 2015 3 3 0 0 12,201 12,147 0 54 100% $3,166,045.37 $4,689,708.93 $386.08 48% 2.62 
YTD FY 2016 15 13 0 2 44,185 41,911 0 2,274 95% $9,841,045.37 $14,477,020.46 $345.42 47% 2.68   
 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 92691 CLEAN CAMP Thurston SP 120 $8,000.00 $8,525.00 $71.04 7% 2.00 Gulley Logging 

 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

September 2015 1 1 0 0 120 120 0 0 100% $8,000.00 $8,525.00 $71.04 7% 2.00 
YTD FY 2016 5 5 0 0 6,546 6,546 0 0 100% $540,000.00 $986,060.99 $150.64 83% 2.00  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

September 2015 4 4 0 0 12,321 12,267 0 54 100% $3,174,045.37 $4,698,233.93 $383.00 48% 2.46 
YTD FY 2016 20 18 0 2 50,731 48,457 0 2,274 96% $10,381,045.37 $15,463,081.45 $319.11 49% 2.49



Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 September 2015 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 90969 PLUMBACK FIT SORT 1 964 $487.50 $176,444.48 0 NO BIDS 
 90970 PLUMBACK FIT SORT 2 746 $575.00 $665.00 $135,444.48 $202,584.48 $271.56 2 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 90971 PLUMBACK FIT SORT 3 258 $314.92 $342.64 $2,811.25 $9,961.25 $38.61 1 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 90972 PLUMBACK FIT SORT 4 131 $450.00 $452.81 $15,313.92 $15,682.03 $119.71 1 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 90973 PLUMBACK FIT SORT 5 281 $198.00 $207.00 ($10,242.45) ($7,713.45) ($27.45) 1 JKCK Resources, Inc. 
 92374 LIBERTY SORT 1 100 $467.50 $467.50 $26,125.95 $26,125.95 $261.26 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 92375 LIBERTY SORT 2 253 $530.00 $530.00 $76,080.78 $76,080.78 $300.71 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 92376 LIBERTY SORT 3 951 $500.00 $515.00 $261,386.67 $275,651.67 $289.85 3 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 92377 LIBERTY SORT 4 643 $490.00 $655.00 $177,258.73 $283,353.73 $440.67 4 Manke Lumber Co. Inc. 
 92378 LIBERTY SORT 5 194 $600.00 $750.00 $72,180.52 $101,280.52 $522.06 5 Manke Lumber Co. Inc. 
 92379 LIBERTY SORT 6 1,277 $625.00 $760.00 $513,730.13 $686,125.13 $537.29 6 Manke Lumber Co. Inc. 
 92380 LIBERTY SORT 7 85 $430.00 $430.00 $16,356.94 $16,356.94 $192.43 1 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 92381 LIBERTY SORT 8 233 $400.00 $455.50 $43,290.13 $56,221.63 $241.29 2 Cascade Hardwoods, Inc. 
 92382 LIBERTY SORT 9 264 $425.00 $510.27 $58,561.68 $81,072.96 $307.09 2 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 92383 LIBERTY SORT 10 54 $510.00 $27,540.00 0 NO BIDS 
 92384 LIBERTY SORT 11 124 $625.00 $716.50 $51,206.36 $62,552.36 $504.45 3 Cascade Hardwoods, Inc. 
 92385 LIBERTY SORT 12 136 $675.00 $830.50 $63,550.70 $84,698.70 $622.78 3 Cascade Hardwoods, Inc. 
 92386 LIBERTY SORT 13 120 $364.00 $364.00 $16,156.15 $16,156.15 $134.63 2 JKCK Resources, Inc. 
 92387 LIBERTY SORT 14 1 $390.00 $442.00 $160.63 $212.63 $212.63 2 JKCK Resources, Inc. 


