
Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 July 2015 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 92054 BOULDER PASS Ferry NE 3168 $585,000.00 $588,000.00 $185.61 1% 1.00 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 92212 WOODMAN ROAD Pend Oreille NE 3738 $804,000.00 $1,187,784.00 $317.76 48% 3.00 Potlatch Land & Lumber LLC 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

July 2015 2 2 0 0 6,906 6,906 0 0 100% $1,389,000.00 $1,775,784.00 $257.14 28% 2.00 
YTD FY 2016 2 2 0 0 6,906 6,906 0 0 100% $1,389,000.00 $1,775,784.00 $257.14 28% 2.00 
 

REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 92163 TACOMA SELECT  Jefferson Ol 3561 $150,000.00 $186,526.76 $52.38 24% 2.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 VDT 

 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

July 2015 1 1 0 0 3,561 3,561 0 0 100% $150,000.00 $186,526.76 $52.38 24% 2.00 
YTD FY 2016 1 1 0 0 3,561 3,561 0 0 100% $150,000.00 $186,526.76 $52.38 24% 2.00  

 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

July 2015 3 3 0 0 10,467 10,467 0 0 100% $1,539,000.00 $1,962,310.76 $187.48 28% 2.00 
YTD FY 2016 3 3 0 0 10,467 10,467 0 0 100% $1,539,000.00 $1,962,310.76 $187.48 28% 2.00 


