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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 August 2015 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 90787 BANGOR Jefferson Ol 3829 $962,000.00 $1,327,142.00 $346.60 38% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 92159 BRUCE ALRIGHTY Lewis PC 3053 $729,000.00 $1,138,829.10 $373.02 56% 5.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 91843 PAR TWO Mason SP 2660 $611,000.00 $1,165,496.82 $438.16 91% 3.00 Murphy Company 
 91854 LEAPING DEER  Skagit NW 4267 $980,000.00 $1,208,095.32 $283.13 23% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 VRH & VDT 
 92368 FAR SOUTH Spokane NE 2184 $321,000.00 $657,269.38 $300.95 105% 2.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 92095 ORIN LOOP Stevens NE 4007 $972,000.00 $1,253,218.39 $312.76 29% 1.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 91555 WADDELL SOUTH Thurston SP 1322 $364,000.00 $692,732.52 $524.00 90% 7.00 Murphy Company 
 92253 GINGER BEARD MAN Whatcom NW 1536 $347,000.00 $568,744.00 $370.28 64% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

August 2015 8 8 0 0 22,858 22,858 0 0 100% $5,286,000.00 $8,011,527.53 $350.49 52% 2.88 
YTD FY 2016 10 10 0 0 29,764 29,764 0 0 100% $6,675,000.00 $9,787,311.53 $328.83 47% 2.70 
   
 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 92554 BIG FOOT BLOWDOWN Clallam Ol 124 $16,000.00 NO BIDS 
 92344 GOODMAN PLUS   Jefferson, Clallam Ol 2096 $117,000.00 NO BIDS 
 DEMO VDT 
 91747 * ELBE HILLS CT  Pierce SP 982 $124,000.00 $213,629.18 $217.54 72% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 92692 * ELBE HILLS   Pierce SP 63 $13,000.00 $13,802.05 $219.08 6% 1.00 D. Painter L.P. 
 CAMPGROUND 
 92026 SWASHBUCKLER  Snohomish NW 1820 $245,000.00 $563,578.00 $309.66 130% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 92691 CLEAN CAMP  Thurston SP 120 $16,000.00 NO BIDS 

 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

August 2015 6 3 0 3 5,205 2,865 0 2,340 55% $382,000.00 $791,009.23 $276.09 107% 2.00 
YTD FY 2016 7 4 0 3 8,766 6,426 0 2,340 73% $532,000.00 $977,535.99 $152.12 84% 2.00 
  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

August 2015 14 11 0 3 28,063 25,723 0 2,340 92% $5,668,000.00 $8,802,536.76 $342.20 55% 2.64 
YTD FY 2016 17 14 0 3 38,530 36,190 0 2,340 94% $7,207,000.00 $10,764,847.52 $297.45 49% 2.50 
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DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 

SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 August 2015 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 90922 AMBER FIT SORT 01 267 $329.92 $350.11 ($29,049.01) ($23,657.00) ($88.60) 2 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 90923 AMBER FIT SORT 02 347 $357.41 $357.59 $6,021.79 $6,086.79 $17.54 1 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 90924 AMBER FIT SORT 03 88 $225.00 $297.00 ($12,414.75) ($6,078.75) ($69.08) 2 Clearwater Paper Corporation 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 FOREST IMPROVEMENT TREATMENT SALES RESULTS 
 August 2015 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    TREATMENT  VOLUME TOTAL     
 NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION ACRES OFFERED MINIMUM  TOTAL BID PRICETOTAL REVENUE NET $ / MBF 
  MBF BID 

 AMBER FIT SORTS Spokane NE 301 702 $231,908.00 $243,701.01 ($23,648.96) ($33.69) 
 PROJECTS  PROJECTS  NOT  TREATMENT  VOLUME  VOLUME  
 OFFERED AWARDED AWARDED ACRES OFFERED AWARDED 

August 2015 1 1 0 301 702 702 
YTD FY 2016 1 1 0 301 702 702 
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