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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 March 2016 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 92601 BEE KEEPER Clark PC 2207 $588,000.00 $726,725.00 $329.28 24% 4.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 92690 COLBY Clark PC 7086 $1,351,000.00 $2,013,320.00 $284.13 49% 3.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 92312 RIDGE WALKER  Cowlitz PC 4018 $898,883.17 $966,073.91 $240.44 7% 1.69 See Sort Sales Results 
 SORTS 
 92762 REMIX Cowlitz PC 3047 $952,000.00 $1,232,213.25 $404.40 29% 5.00 Murphy Company 
 91937 NORTHWEST Grays Harbor SP 6304 $1,766,000.00 $1,918,123.00 $304.27 9% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 91857 LOWER SWAN Grays Harbor,  SP 4648 $1,241,000.00 $1,652,988.00 $355.63 33% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 Thurston 
 92816 BEACON BITS Jefferson, Mason Ol 1800 $418,000.00 $513,027.69 $285.02 23% 2.00 Murphy Company 
 92563 * FERN HOPPER King SP 2297 $493,000.00 $868,044.70 $377.90 76% 4.00 Manke Lumber Co. Inc. 
 93223 WEST FORK FIRE  Okanogan NE 7210 $250,000.00 NO BIDS 
 SALVAGE 
 92229 NEWMAN VRH &  Skagit NW 4897 $740,000.00 $747,513.00 $152.65 1% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 VDT 
 92619 CASKEY WEST  Skagit NW 1692 $481,000.00 $806,513.00 $476.66 68% 4.00 Nielsen Brothers Inc. 
 VRH and GAP CUTS 

 93250 ALLEN FIRE  Stevens NE 9621 $1,118,000.00 $1,450,355.70 $150.75 30% 2.00 IFG Timber, LLC 
 SALVAGE 
 93304 BLACKHORSE FIRE  Stevens NE 5107 $622,000.00 $941,844.75 $184.42 51% 2.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 SALVAGE 
 92575 FAVORABLE Wahkiakum PC 6367 $1,023,000.00 $1,725,395.00 $270.99 69% 4.00 Columbia Vista Corporation 
 93074 MILL FIR SORTS Wahkiakum PC 4658 $1,654,554.86 $1,289,056.04 $276.74 -22% 1.80 See Sort Sales Results 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

March 2016 15 14 0 1 70,959 62,094 0 8,865 90% $12,783,441.39 $16,851,193.04 $271.38 32% 2.68 
YTD FY 2016 82 78 0 4 337,739 326,242 0 11,497 97% $71,980,328.86 $99,219,450.93 $304.13 38% 2.62 
  
 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 90940 N-1100 VDT Jefferson Ol 3460 $69,000.00 $75,789.68 $21.90 10% 1.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 

 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

March 2016 1 1 0 0 3,460 3,460 0 0 100% $69,000.00 $75,789.68 $21.90 10% 1.00 
YTD FY 2016 7 7 0 0 12,102 12,102 0 0 100% $695,000.00 $1,175,527.67 $97.13 69% 1.71 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

March 2016 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

March 2016 16 15 0 1 74,419 65,554 0 8,865 90% $12,852,441.39 $16,926,982.72 $258.21 32% 2.57 
YTD FY 2016 89 85 0 4 349,841 338,344 0 11,497 97% $72,675,328.86 $100,394,978.60 $296.72 38% 2.55 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 March 2016 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 92327 RIDGE WALKER SORT 15 259 $440.00 $440.64 $60,639.67 $60,805.43 $234.77 1 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 92328 RIDGE WALKER SORT 16 751 $510.00 $559.56 $231,292.98 $268,512.54 $357.54 2 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 93018 RIDGE WALKER SORT 17 265 $525.00 $567.50 $85,451.90 $96,714.40 $364.96 1 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 93019 RIDGE WALKER SORT 18 292 $525.00 $592.00 $93,472.12 $113,036.12 $387.11 3 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 93020 RIDGE WALKER SORT 19 66 $550.00 $602.00 $23,164.68 $26,596.68 $402.98 2 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 93021 RIDGE WALKER SORT 20 217 $365.60 $79,335.00 0 NO BIDS 
 93021 RIDGE WALKER SORT 20 217 $382.60 $83,025.00 0 NO BIDS 
 93022 RIDGE WALKER SORT 21 837 $400.00 $448.00 $98,958.51 $139,134.51 $166.23 1 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 93024 RIDGE WALKER SORT 22 356 $425.00 $461.00 $59,227.72 $72,043.72 $202.37 2 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 93025 RIDGE WALKER SORT 23 397 $400.00 $438.01 $61,495.30 $76,585.27 $192.91 3 Columbia Vista Corporation 
 93026 RIDGE WALKER SORT 24 506 $425.00 $438.27 $98,776.26 $105,490.88 $208.48 3 Columbia Vista Corporation 
 93027 RIDGE WALKER SORT 25 7 $302.86 $315.05 $663.93 $749.26 $107.04 1 Cascade Hardwoods, Inc. 
 93028 RIDGE WALKER SORT 26 5 $364.00 $364.00 $492.70 $492.70 $98.54 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 
 93029 RIDGE WALKER SORT 27 59 $364.00 $364.00 $5,813.86 $5,813.86 $98.54 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 
 93030 RIDGE WALKER SORT 28 1 $364.00 $364.00 $98.54 $98.54 $98.54 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 
 93075 MILL FIR SORT 1 624 $500.00 $526.00 $228,053.28 $244,277.28 $391.47 3 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 93076 MILL FIR SORT 2 954 $525.00 $532.07 $385,072.56 $391,817.34 $410.71 3 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 93077 MILL FIR SORT 3 987 $475.00 $359,149.56 0 NO BIDS 
 93079 MILL FIR SORT 5 246 $550.00 $600.00 $104,471.28 $116,771.28 $474.68 3 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 93080 MILL FIR SORT 6 168 $500.00 $508.28 $61,990.32 $63,381.36 $377.27 1 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 93081 MILL FIR SORT 7 174 $1,100.00 $1,427.50 $167,671.62 $224,656.62 $1,291.13 2 RSG Forest Products, Inc. 
 93082 MILL FIR SORT 8 222 $400.00 $413.00 $50,374.02 $53,260.02 $239.91 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 93083 MILL FIR SORT 9 557 $425.00 $451.00 $127,285.64 $141,767.64 $254.52 1 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 93084 MILL FIR SORT 10 451 $390.00 $124,512.08 0 NO BIDS 
 93085 MILL FIR SORT 11 185 $364.00 $390.00 $30,928.30 $35,738.30 $193.18 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 
 93086 MILL FIR SORT 12 77 $364.00 $390.00 $12,872.86 $14,874.86 $193.18 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 
 93087 MILL FIR SORT 13 13 $364.00 $390.00 $2,173.34 $2,511.34 $193.18 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 
 93522 DEER FIRE SALVAGE SORT 01 1,387 $335.00 $475.00 $100,604.13 $294,784.13 $212.53 3 Potlatch Land & Lumber LLC 
 93523 DEER FIRE SALVAGE SORT 02 1,095 $342.00 $432.00 $97,901.63 $196,451.63 $179.41 4 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 93524 DEER FIRE SALVAGE SORT 03 1,449 $268.78 $268.81 ($1,006.75) ($964.75) ($0.67) 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 93525 DEER FIRE SALVAGE SORT 04 88 $239.80 $239.80 $617.83 $617.83 $7.02 1 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 93526 DEER FIRE SALVAGE SORT 05 47 $229.92 $230.58 ($3,529.39) ($3,498.69) ($74.44) 2 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 93528 DEER FIRE SALVAGE SORT 07 1,983 $291.50 $291.61 $88,859.15 $89,069.35 $44.92 1 IFG Timber, LLC 
 93529 DEER FIRE SALVAGE SORT 08 1,557 $310.02 $322.39 $75,545.98 $94,801.98 $60.89 2 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 93530 DEER FIRE SALVAGE SORT 09 332 $682.09 $704.10 $163,153.55 $170,458.55 $513.43 2 Columbia Cedar, Inc. 
 93531 CLEVELAND FIRE SALVAGE SORT 01 660 $335.00 $405.00 $51,023.53 $97,223.53 $147.31 3 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 93532 CLEVELAND FIRE SALVAGE SORT 02 716 $342.00 $432.00 $26,370.94 $90,810.94 $126.83 4 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 93533 CLEVELAND FIRE SALVAGE SORT 03 574 $268.83 $268.83 ($31,154.28) ($31,154.28) ($54.28) 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 93534 CLEVELAND FIRE SALVAGE SORT 04 288 $239.80 $239.80 ($11,989.54) ($11,989.54) ($41.63) 1 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 93535 CLEVELAND FIRE SALVAGE SORT 05 177 $230.34 $260.12 ($24,015.13) ($18,742.97) ($105.89) 2 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 93537 CLEVELAND FIRE SALVAGE SORT 07 366 $291.53 $291.64 ($9,463.45) ($9,424.65) ($25.75) 1 IFG Timber, LLC 
 93538 CLEVELAND FIRE SALVAGE SORT 08 184 $310.05 $322.46 ($663.81) $1,618.19 $8.79 2 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 FOREST IMPROVEMENT TREATMENT SALES RESULTS 
 March 2016 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    TREATMENT  VOLUME TOTAL     
 NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION ACRES OFFERED MINIMUM  TOTAL BID PRICETOTAL REVENUE NET $ / MBF 
  MBF BID 

 CLEVELAND FIRE SALVAGE SORTS   Stevens NE 653 2,965 $893,862.00 $1,012,094.96 $118,341.22 $39.91 

 DEER FIRE SALVAGE SORTS   Stevens NE 1,038 7,938 $2,547,714.80 $2,867,288.70 $841,720.03 $106.04 
 PROJECTS  PROJECTS  NOT  TREATMENT  VOLUME  VOLUME  
 OFFERED AWARDED AWARDED ACRES OFFERED AWARDED 

March 2016 2 2 0 1,691 10,903 10,903 
YTD FY 2016 6 6 0 4,342 21,473 21,473 

 


