
 

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 April 2016 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 93140 CHUM Clallam Ol 6762 $1,054,000.00 $1,060,806.00 $156.88 1% 1.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 93309 SPLINTER SORTS Cowlitz PC 5276 $1,568,903.11 $2,000,420.23 $379.15 28% 2.38 See Sort Sales Results 
 92744 LYTLES LEG VRH  Grays Harbor SP 10864 $2,763,000.00 $3,903,924.00 $359.34 41% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 & VDT 
 93154 X FACTOR Grays Harbor PC 5035 $1,082,000.00 $1,290,381.78 $256.28 19% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 91787 HUZZA King SP 1771 $326,000.00 $327,006.00 $184.64 0% 1.00 A & W Timber Brokers, Inc. 
 92824 SAWMILL   Pacific PC 878 $45,000.00 $68,568.90 $78.10 52% 3.00 Double Mountain Development, LLC 
 THINNING 
 91190 BLITZEN Skagit NW 2692 $591,000.00 $733,047.00 $272.31 24% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 92631 RAVEN VRH&VDT  Skagit NW 7863 $2,268,000.00 $3,277,162.25 $416.78 44% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 91789 SIDEHILL SALMON Snohomish SP 1799 $376,000.00 $508,805.00 $282.83 35% 2.00 A & W Timber Brokers, Inc. 
 92303 DYNO VRH & VDT Snohomish NW 3880 $360,000.00 $879,275.00 $226.62 144% 3.00 Pulley Corporation 
 93095 URSA MAJOR Snohomish NW 2812 $719,000.00 $981,996.00 $349.22 37% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 93074 MILL FIR SORTS Wahkiakum PC 1438 $213,393.05 $312,093.05 $217.03 46% 3.50 See Sort Sales Results 
 93008 MATTS BACKYARD Whatcom NW 1465 $390,000.00 $601,173.00 $410.36 54% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

April 2016 13 13 0 0 52,535 52,535 0 0 100% $11,756,296.16 $15,944,658.21 $303.51 36% 2.07 
YTD FY 2016 91 90 0 1 386,941 378,777 0 8,164 99% $83,736,625.02 $115,164,109.14 $304.04 38% 2.55 

 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 
None Offered 

SUMMARY OF REGION SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

YTD FY 2016 8 7 0 1 12,226 12,102 0 124 99% $695,000.00 $1,175,527.67 $97.13 69% 1.71 
  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

April 2016 13 13 0 0 52,535 52,535 0 0 100% $11,756,296.16 $15,944,658.21 $303.51 36% 2.07 
YTD FY 2016 100 97 0 3 399,167 390,879 0 8,288 99% $84,431,625.02 $116,339,636.81 $297.64 38% 2.49 
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DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 

April 2016

Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected)
VOLUME TOTAL 

AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM BID MINIMUM TOTAL BID PRICE # OF APPARENT 
MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

93077 MILL FIR SORT 3 987 $350.00 $450.00 $148,494.15 $247,194.15 $250.45 4 Fritch Mill, Inc.
93084 MILL FIR SORT 10 451 $275.00 $275.00 $64,898.90 $64,898.90 $143.90 3 Stimson Lumber Company, Inc.
93310 SPLINTER SORT 1 468 $440.00 $451.12 $111,070.44 $116,274.60 $248.45 2 Interfor U.S., Inc.
93311 SPLINTER SORT 2 274 $525.00 $551.50 $83,849.48 $91,110.48 $332.52 3 RSG Forest Products, Inc.
93312 SPLINTER SORT 3 240 $550.00 $559.75 $81,132.00 $83,472.00 $347.80 2 Interfor U.S., Inc.
93313 SPLINTER SORT 4 215 $490.00 $515.00 $58,656.30 $64,031.30 $297.82 2 Stimson Lumber Company, Inc.
93314 SPLINTER SORT 5 540 $550.00 $710.00 $127,202.40 $213,602.40 $395.56 4 Pacific Veneer, LTD
93315 SPLINTER SORT 6 1,376 $575.00 $771.00 $350,384.64 $620,080.64 $450.64 5 Canyon Lumber Company, Inc.
93316 SPLINTER SORT 7 180 $600.00 $771.00 $53,222.40 $84,002.40 $466.68 3 Canyon Lumber Company, Inc.
93317 SPLINTER SORT 8 38 $600.00 $605.56 $13,963.86 $14,175.14 $373.03 2 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc.
93318 SPLINTER SORT 9 17 $400.00 $405.34 $2,846.99 $2,937.77 $172.81 2 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc.
93319 SPLINTER SORT 10 557 $400.00 $483.86 $53,338.32 $100,048.34 $179.62 4 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
93320 SPLINTER SORT 11 309 $425.00 $425.00   $55,839.39 $55,839.39 $180.71 2 RSG Forest Products, Inc.
93321 SPLINTER SORT 12 567 $850.00 $1,050.00 $341,611.83 $455,011.83 $802.49 2 McFarland Cascade Holdings, Inc.
93322 SPLINTER SORT 13 81 $364.00 $390.00 $8,402.94 $10,508.94 $129.74 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.
93323 SPLINTER SORT 14 53 $364.00 $390.00 $5,498.22 $6,876.22 $129.74 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.
93324 SPLINTER SORT 15 25 $364.00 $390.00 $2,593.50 $3,243.50 $129.74 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.
93714 SPLINTER SORT 16 336 $450.00 $458.08 $76,490.40 $79,205.28 $235.73 2 Columbia Vista Corporation


