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VOLUME
AGREEMENT FSC REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

∞ MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
83198 OLY 5,301 $306,000
83961 OLY 856 $391,000
83025 PC 4,218 $364,000
83265 PC 4,204 $520,000
83829 PC 4,298 $403,000 $468,577.00 $109.02 16% 1
84058 PC 2,403 $338,000
81044 OLY 2,607 $296,000
83761 PC 936 $466,000
83859 PC 5,064 $584,000 $1,016,466.00 $200.72 74% 11
82599 ∞ Mason SPS 916 $367,104 $346,596.22 $378.38 6% 1.3
84051 PC 4,743 $584,000 $665,920.00 $140.40 14% 2
83687 NW 1,981 $266,000 $414,276.00 $209.12 56% 3
83758 NW 3,097 $526,000
83333 PC 6,481 $659,000 $783,340.64 $120.87 19% 1
82129 NW 9,564 $716,000 $1,771,000.67 $185.17 147% 4
83286 NW 8,751 $762,000
83380 NW 6,020 $498,000
83702 NW 2,116 $326,000 $471,531.60 $222.84 45% 5
82779 NW 3,062 $285,000
83668 NW 2,115 $364,000 $472,830.00 $223.56 30% 4
83727 NW 3,222 $527,000 $839,965.00 $260.70 59% 3

 JUNE 2009

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 12 10 0 2 42,292 40,500 1,792 96% $4,796,104 $7,250,503 $179 51% 3.53

FY 09

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 110 94 0 16 513,323 438,794 74,529 85% $70,343,692 $85,880,052 $196 22% 2.73

Clallam
Clallam

Clark
Cowlitz
Cowlitz

Snohomish
Snohomish

Mr. Jones
Backflip Poles Lewis

Grass Hut Skagit
Greenstone Skamania

Clark

* Contract Harvesting Sort; bid values converted from delivered value to estimated stumpage rate.

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

Oso Low

Boekelman Ridge

Reiterate
A.L.R.T. Corporation

Snohomish
Snohomish
Whatcom
Whatcom
Whatcom

Sierra Pacific Industries
Sierra Pacific Industries

Catalina
Pickin' Up Pieces

Sugaree VRH & VDT WITHDRAWN

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Board Sales Results

June 12-25, 2009

Joyce Dry Pole

APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

WITHDRAWN
NO BIDS

NAME OF SALE

Piedmont Hill

COUNTY

Prospero Skagit Sierra Pacific Industries

Lanky Sorts * See Chart on Page 4

YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 

WITHDRAWN

Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P.
WITHDRAWN

Worthy Adversary

Slide Divide WITHDRAWN

WITHDRAWN

Long Bottom

Rashford Ridge

WITHDRAWN

Bear Fun WITHDRAWN

Simpson Lumber Company, LLC

Pacific Manke Timber Company, Inc.

WITHDRAWN
High Cascade, Inc.
Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.

NO BIDS
Lewis

Power Out

Bare Back Grays Harbor
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VOLUME
AGREEMENT FSC REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

∞ MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
82513 OLY 2,754 $83,000 $84,402.00 $30.65 2% 1
83201 OLY 3,015 $220,000
83960 OLY 363 $32,000 $69,997.75 $192.83 119% 6
81286 OLY 2,827 $101,000
84215 OLY 1,209 $19,000 $112,233.02 $92.83 491% 7
82503 OLY 3,154 $64,000 $217,320.54 $68.90 240% 5
82789 OLY 202 $5,000 $10,505.00 $52.00 110% 4
83202 OLY 1,572 $103,000
83219 SPS 1,654 $93,000 $128,320.00 $77.58 38% 2
84054 SE 2,008 $190,000 $366,103.39 $182.32 93% 6
81563 SPS 2,239 $200,000
81729 NW 934 $59,000
84043 SE 2,152 $27,000

 JUNE 2009

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 8 7 0 1 13,496 11,344 2,152 84% $486,000 $988,882 $87 103% 4.43

FY 09

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 51 43 0 8 71,084 50,662 20,422 71% $3,717,920 $5,480,550 $108 47% 3.14

JUNE 2009

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 20 17 0 3 55,788 51,844 3,944 93% $5,282,104 $8,239,385 $159 56% 3.90

FY 09

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 162 138 0 24 584,407 489,456 94,951 84% $74,061,612 $91,360,602 $187 23% 2.86

FY 09

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 15 15 0 0 66,597 66,597 0 100% $2,394,937 $3,878,706 $58 62% 2.73

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGION SALES

YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF REGION SALES

SUMMARY OF REGION SALES

Bus Boy 2 Blowdown Jefferson

Skagit
Yakima

Dow

YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGION SALES

Hoh River Timber, Inc.
Old Goat WITHDRAWN
Winery A&W Timber Brokers, Inc.
Dymond Knot

Jefferson
King
Klickitat
Mason

YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF ALL WINDSTORM SALVAGE SALES FOR

Cold Springs Fire Salvage 2

Grays Harbor
Grays Harbor
Jefferson TMI Forest Products, Inc.

Region Sales Results
June 12-25, 2009

Park Access Blowdown

NO BIDS

High Cascade, Inc.

Bridgewater Logging, Inc.

WITHDRAWN

APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

Munro LLC

Gold Member Blowdown
Woodlawn Gone Blowdown

COUNTY

Interfor Pacific, Inc.
WITHDRAWN

Pleasantine

NAME OF SALE

Cove Power

Big Trout Blowdown Clallam
Clallam
Clallam

WITHDRAWNMorice VDT & VRH
WITHDRAWN

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
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FSC REGION
∞

83764 NE 1,525 $284.18 $284.18 $433,368.80 $433,001 $0.24 771
83217 NE 487 $287.94 $288.47 $140,485.33 $136,099 $9.01 217
84372 SE 1,500 $173.35 $280.82 $421,227.10 $498,061 ($51.22) 351
83266 NE 1,083 Sale Pending 643
84036 NE 1,971 $247.53 $249.04 $490,858.90 $490,769 $0.05 447
84128 NE 382 $257.94 $260.77 $99,614.41 $99,594 $0.05 80
81629 SE 1,708 $183.38 $216.42 $369,640.14 $494,045 ($72.84) 0
82491 SE 3,921 $140.85 $234.00 $917,533.40 $1,044,944 ($32.49) 346

Notes:
1. Volumes are listed only in the following chart.  Forest Improvement Treatment sales are silvicultural activities and the volume is not part of the sustainable harvest or similar targets.
2. Volumes and values in the FIT table above are project totals .  Pending sales are not included until all sorts are sold.
3. Acres for Cougar Bacon FIT Sorts were accounted for during phase one of the project.

JUNE 2009

SALES SALES VOLUME TREATMENT FIT SALES
OFFERED SOLD OFFERED ACRES PENDING

TOTALS 8 7 12,577 11,494 2,212 1

FY 09

SALES SALES VOLUME TREATMENT
OFFERED SOLD OFFERED ACRES

TOTALS 17 16 24,361 23,278 5,193

* Bid prices are converted from delivered value to stumpage based upon estimated costs, at the time of auction
   Note:  Pending sales are not included in this table until all sorts are sold.

TREATMENT           
ACRES

TOTAL 
APPRAISED 
PRICE /MBF

TOTAL             
COSTS

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

Kittitas
Stevens
Stevens
Stevens

Cougar Bacon FIT Sorts II Yakima
Yakima

SALES NOT AWARDED

YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF FOREST IMPROVEMENT TREATMENT (FIT) SALES 

VOLUME  SOLD

SALES NOT AWARDED

0

VOLUME  SOLD

COUNTY
VOLUME 
OFFERED 

(MBF)

SUMMARY OF FOREST IMPROVEMENT TREATMENT (FIT) SALES

AGREEMENT REVENUE

Copperbottom FIT Sorts $4,386.70

TOTAL BID 
PRICE /MBF 

TOTAL BID 
PRICE 

Bonaparte FIT Sorts Okanogan
Stevens

Little Joe FIT Sorts ($76,833.83)

Cricket FIT Sorts $89.53
Thin Blue Ridge FIT Sorts $20.51

Let It Beetle FIT Sorts ($127,410.85)

Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected)

June 12-25, 2009
Forest Improvement Treatment Sales Project Summary

$367.77

NET 
$/MBFNAME OF SALE

($124,405.17)

Roo FIT Sorts

0
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MINIMUM BID TOTAL TOTAL
AGREEMENT FSC BID/ MBF PRICE/ MBF MINIMUM PRICE PRICE

∞ (Delivered) (Delivered) BID BID /MBF
84078 ∞ $472.00 $472.00 $102,785.27 $95,120.90 $273.34 1
84079 ∞ $744.00 $744.00 $252,571.23 $240,942.08 $540.23 1
84082 ∞ $245.00 $251.00 $11,747.75 $10,533.24 $86.34 2
84086 ∞ $245.00

$367,104.25 $346,596.22 $378.38 1.3

 SORT Sales Results (By Sale)
June 12-25, 2009

Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected)

VOLUME NUMBER OF 
BIDS APPARENT HIGH BIDDER

NAME OF SALE

D
on

e

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

Lanky Sort #1 348

916

Stella Jones Corporation
Lanky Sort #2 446 Bell Timber, Inc.
Lanky Sort #5 122 Buse Timber & Sales, Inc.
Lanky Sort #9 8 CANCELLED
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TOTAL TOTAL
AGREEMENT FSC MINIMUM BID MINIMUM PRICE PRICE

∞ BID/ MBF PRICE/ MBF BID BID /MBF
84093 $300.00 $300.00 $21,107.94 $17,527.44 $21.25 1
84094 $217.44 $217.44 ($3,645.24) ($3,645.24) -$30.13 1

$17,462.70 $13,882.20 $14.67 1.0
84088 $290.40 $292.14 $5,864.95 $5,936.47 $39.84 2
84089 $222.50 $222.50 ($174.74) ($174.74) -$14.56 1
84090 $210.45 $210.45 ($1,182.84) ($1,182.84) -$45.49 1

$4,507.37 $4,578.89 $24.49 1.3
84373 $132.75 $329.81 ($33,178.62) $8,416.22 $25.50 4
84374 $159.73 $186.20 ($27,945.75) ($24,748.01) -$107.13 3
84375 $190.97 $286.65 ($135,816.02) ($60,502.04) -$64.43 3

($196,940.39) ($76,833.83) -$51.22 3.3
83691 $284.61 $284.61 $22,461.82 $23,682.07 $77.14 1
83692
83693 $295.00 $310.50 $3,497.49 $5,018.82 $66.04 2
83694 $229.35 $229.90 $260.22 $476.92 $23.85 1
83695 $282.00 $285.00 ($245.15) $80.35 $4.02 1
83696 $178.00 $180.00 ($6,932.50) ($5,526.97) -$34.33 1

$19,041.88 $23,731.19 $21.91 1.2
84225 $296.00 $307.86 $9,320.55 $11,577.75 $70.17 2
84226 $223.30 $223.30 $3,369.02 $1,787.11 $4.54 1
84227
84228 $264.60 $264.60 ($10,059.59) ($15,956.53) -$13.83 1
84229 $177.30 $177.30 $2,681.20 $2,681.20 $10.39 1

$5,311.18 $89.53 $0.05 1.3
84221 $296.00 $317.25 $1,216.03 $1,769.44 $76.93 2
84222 $222.30 $222.30 $196.22 $196.22 $5.95 1
84223 $282.00 $284.25 ($1,516.93) ($107.23) -$0.42 1
84224 $177.30 $177.30 ($1,837.92) ($1,837.92) -$25.53 1

($1,942.60) $20.51 $0.05 1.3
84252 $183.50 $255.97 ($16,358.82) ($49,219.74) -$103.40 3
84253 $198.81 $199.23 ($25,197.50) ($34,287.26) -$62.57 3
84254 $149.63 $240.00 ($17,274.17) ($20,338.49) -$127.12 2
84255 $100.00 $122.50 ($43,805.73) ($8,871.41) -$29.38 3
84255 $279.00 $279.00 ($5,562.43) $1,257.57 $5.66 3

($108,198.65) ($111,459.33) -$65.26 2.8
83996 $200.00 $246.92 ($52,236.49) ($30,316.57) -$35.50 2
83997 $209.35 $209.35 ($7,708.24) ($5,845.84) -$21.49 2
83998 $116.00 $232.58 ($299,099.10) ($91,248.44) -$32.65 4

($359,043.83) ($127,410.85) -$32.49 2.7
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121
825

Roo FIT Sort #5 20

Roo FIT Sort #1 307

33

Cougar Bacon FIT Sort #8 160

D
on

e

2,795

Cougar Bacon FIT Sort #9 302 Mt. Adams Resource Stewards

149
946

FIT SORT Sales Results (By Sort)
June 12-25, 2009

Vaagen Brothers Lumber, Inc.

Stumpage Determination (Projected)Delivered Values

Vaagen Brothers Lumber, Inc.
Roo FIT Sort #6

NUMBER OF 
BIDS APPARENT HIGH BIDDER

NAME OF SALE

Bonaparte FIT Sort #2

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

VOLUME

939 Boise White Paper, LLC

D
on

e
D

on
e

Little Joe FIT Sort #1 330 Boise Building Solutions, Marketing, LLC.

Bonaparte FIT Sort #1 Vaagen Brothers Lumber, Inc.

Copperbottom FIT Sort #2 Vaagen Brothers Lumber, Inc.
Copperbottom FIT Sort #1 Boise Building Solutions, Marketing, LLC.

Copperbottom FIT Sort #3 Boise Building Solutions, Marketing, LLC.
12
26

187

1,500
Boise Building Solutions, Marketing, LLC.

Roo FIT Sort #2 499 NO BIDS

Roo FIT Sort #4 20 Vaagen Brothers Lumber, Inc.
Roo FIT Sort #3 76 Boise Building Solutions, Marketing, LLC.

Vaagen Brothers Lumber, Inc.
382

Thin Blue Ridge FIT Sort #4

High Cascade, Inc.

161 Vaagen Brothers Lumber, Inc.
1,083

Cricket FIT Sort #1 165 Boise Building Solutions, Marketing, LLC.

23 Boise Building Solutions, Marketing, LLC.

Cricket FIT Sort #5 258 Vaagen Brothers Lumber, Inc.
1,971

Cricket FIT Sort #2

Boise White Paper, LLC

Cougar Bacon FIT Sort #10

Little Joe FIT Sort #2 231 Boise White Paper, LLC
Little Joe FIT Sort #3

Cougar Bacon FIT Sort #6 476 Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.

394 Vaagen Brothers Lumber, Inc.
Cricket FIT Sort #3 NO BIDS  -- CANCELLED
Cricket FIT Sort #4 1,154 Vaagen Brothers Lumber, Inc.

Thin Blue Ridge FIT Sort #3 254 Vaagen Brothers Lumber, Inc.

Thin Blue Ridge FIT Sort #1
Thin Blue Ridge FIT Sort #2 Vaagen Brothers Lumber, Inc.

72

Dodge Logging
3,921

1,708
Let It Beetle FIT Sort #1 854 Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.
Let It Beetle FIT Sort #2 272 Boise White Paper, LLC
Let It Beetle FIT Sort #3

222 Mt. Adams Resource Stewards

Cougar Bacon FIT Sort #7 548
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