DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Board Sales Results
January 27-29, 2009

VOLUME
AGREEMENT | FSC NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT
s MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER
83212 HEY LOUIE Clallam OLY 3,643 $503,000 NO BIDS
82784 BERRY PATCH Clark PC 9,406 $1,926,000 NO BIDS
82878 SEA OF GOLD Clark PC 10,466 $2,127,000 $3,012,000.00 $287.79 42% 3 Fundtime Logging
82601 LEAN MAC Lewis PC 4,087 $964,000 $1,142,989.00 $279.66 19% 3 Merrill & Ring Forest Products, LP
78981 MISSION BEARABLE Mason SPS 1,657 $362,000 $445,356.00 $268.77 23% 4 Western Timber, Inc.
82688 CROSSIN' DA LINE Pacific PC 6,538 $1,388,000 NO BIDS
82890 DODGEBALL Pacific PC 5,689 $909,000 $1,023,000.00 $179.82 13% 2 Don Painter Logging
82034 ANDROMEDA Skagit NW 3,205 $831,000 NO BIDS
81492 NORTH MOUNTAIN THIN VDT Snohomish/Skagit NW 7,141 $424,000 NO BIDS
82423 MAPLE YARD Whatcom NW 3,021 $302,000 $304,378.31 $100.75 1% 1 Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.
~  If marked, all or part of this sale is certified under Forest Stewardship Council Certificate No. BV-FM/COC-080501
SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES JANUARY 2009
SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS
TOTALS 10 5 5 54,853 24,920 29,933 45% $4,664,000 $5,927,723 $238 27%| 2.60
YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES FY 09
SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS
TOTALS 64 51 10 274,708 228,821 45,887 83% $40,779,062 $51,095,262 $223 25%| 3.01

Department of Natural Resources, information subject to changes and amendments over time.
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DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Region Sales Results
January 27-29, 2009

VOLUME
AGREEMENT | FSC NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT
0 MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER
82504 OCTOPUS TALES Jefferson OLY 923 $144,000 NO BIDS
82477 BULL CHUTE Klickitat SE 1,148 $105,000 $108,838.77 $94.81 4% 1 High Cascade, Inc.
« If marked, all or part of this sale is certified under Forest Stewardship Council Certificate No. BV-FM/COC-080501
SUMMARY OF REGION SALES JANUARY 2009

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #

OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 2 1 1 2,071 1,148 923 55% $105,000 $108,839 $95 4%| 1.00

YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF REGION SALES FY 09

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #

OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 25 22 3 23,240 17,955 5,285 77% $1,964,920 $2,743,416 $153 40%| 2.64

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGION SALES JANUARY 2009

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #

OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 12 6 6 56,924 26,068 30,856 46% $4,769,000 $6,036,562 $232 27%| 2.33

YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGION SALES FY 09

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #

OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 86 73 13 297,948 246,776 51,172 83% $42,743,982 $53,838,679 $218 26%| 2.90

YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF ALL WINDSTORM SALVAGE SALES FOR FY 09

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #

OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 15 15 0 66,597 66,597 0 100% $2,394,937 $3,878,706 $58 62%| 2.73

Department of Natural Resources, information subject to changes and amendments over time.
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DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Forest Improvement Treatment Sales Results
January 27-29, 2009

Delivered Values

Stumpage Determination (Projected

AGREEMENT

FSC

NAME OF SALE

COUNTY

REGION

VOLUME
OFFERED
(MBF)

TOTAL
APPRAISED
PRICE /MBF

TOTAL BID
PRICE /MBF

TOTAL BID
PRICE

TOTAL
COSTS

REVENUE

NET
$/MBF

TREATMENT
ACRES

No FIT Sales This Month

Notes:

1. Volumes are summarized only in the following chart. Forest Improvement Treatment sales are silvicultural activities and the volume is not part of the sustainable harvest or similar targets.

oo If marked, all or part of this sale is certified under Forest Stewardship Council Certificate No. BV-FM/COC-080501

* Bid prices are converted from delivered value to stumpage based upon estimated costs, at the time of auction

SUMMARY OF FOREST IMPROVEMENT TREATMENT (FIT) SALES JANUARY 2009
SALES SALES SALES NOT VOLUME TREATMENT
OFFERED SOLD AWARDED OFFERED VOLUME SOLD ACRES
TOTALS 0 0 0 0
YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF FOREST IMPROVEMENT TREATMENT (FIT) SALES FY 09
SALES SALES SALES NOT VOLUME TREATMENT
OFFERED SOLD AWARDED OFFERED VOLUME SOLD ACRES
TOTALS 1 1,500 0 0

Department of Natural Resources, information subject to changes and amendments over time.
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