
VOLUME
AGREEMENT FSC COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

∞ MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
81726 Clark PC 3,020 $532,000 $532,101.00 $176.19 0% 1
82451 Ferry NE 5,701 $761,000 $807,000.00 $141.55 6% 2
82070 Grays Harbor PC 5,432 $1,095,000 $1,100,475.41 $202.59 1% 2
81781 Jefferson OLY 648 $379,000 $402,150.00 $620.60 6% 2
82478 Klickitat SE 1,909 $320,000 $322,502.00 $168.94 1% 1
81578 Mason SPS 2,050 $402,000 $546,324.00 $266.50 36% 5
81845 Pacific PC 2,830 $549,000
81717 Skagit NW 3,019 $953,000
82264 Skagit NW 1 615 $319 000 $329 000 00 $203 72 3% 1

Murphy Company
Marshall Forestry, LLCNORTH STORM KING

NAME OF SALE

COPPER

APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

Rayonier Forest Operations, LLC

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Board Sales Results

December 15-19, 2008

MELODY
McFarland Cascade Pole & Lumber Co.
High Cascade, Inc.

Sierra Pacific Industries

NO BIDS
NO BIDS

Merrill & Ring Forest Products , LP

TOANDOS POLE

INBETWEEN
FINAL GRADE
SPARE TIRE
BOX CAR

GHOUDA
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82264 Skagit NW 1,615 $319,000 $329,000.00 $203.72 3% 1
82555 Skagit NW 6,694 $1,533,000 $1,705,048.00 $254.71 11% 3
82605 Skagit/Snohomish NW 10,593 $1,921,000 $3,306,421.24 $312.13 72% 3
82229 ∞ Thurston PC 5,124 $1,220,000 $1,475,914.00 $288.04 21% 3
81551 Whatcom NW 5,443 $491,000 $543,062.40 $99.77 11% 1
81711 Whatcom NW 2,483 $422,000
82126 Whatcom NW 3,484 $691,000
82484 Yakima SE 7,760 $862,000 $958,351.68 $123.50 11% 3

 DECEMBER 2008

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 16 12 4 67,805 55,989 11,816 83% $9,835,000 $12,028,350 $215 22% 2.25

FY 09

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #

EAGLE VIEW

DIDGERIDOO

Sierra Pacific Industries
HIGH SORENSON

Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.
Great Western Lumber Co.

BOX CAR

TIE

NO BIDS

McFarland Cascade Pole & Lumber Co.
Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.

MAYFLOWER
SOUTH PASS HARDWOOD
VANDAL

YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 

High Cascade, Inc.
NO BIDS

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS
TOTALS 54 46 8 233,222 203,901 29,321 87.4% $36,115,062 $45,167,539 $222 25% 3.06

∞  If marked, all or part of this sale is certified under Forest Stewardship Council Certificate No. BV-FM/COC-080501
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VOLUME
AGREEMENT FSC COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

∞ MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
83662 YAKIMA SE 2,528 $69,000 $77,351.99 $30.60 12% 1

 DECEMBER 2008

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 1 1 0 2 528 2 528 0 100% $69 000 $77 352 $31 12% 1 00

T L Fitzer Logging, Inc.COLD SPRINGS FIRE SALVAGE 1 

Region Sales Results
December 15-19, 2008

NAME OF SALE APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

SUMMARY OF REGION SALES
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TOTALS 1 1 0 2,528 2,528 0 100% $69,000 $77,352 $31 12% 1.00

FY 09

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 23 21 2 23,697 16,807 6,890 70.9% $1,859,920 $2,634,578 $157 42% 2.71

DECEMBER 2008

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 17 13 4 70,333 58,517 11,816 83% $9,904,000 $12,105,702 $207 22% 2.15

FY 09

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 77 67 10 254,391 220,708 33,683 86.8% $37,974,982 $47,802,117 $217 26% 2.95

YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF REGION SALES

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGION SALES

YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGION SALES

TOTALS 77 67 10 254,391 220,708 33,683 86.8% $37,974,982 $47,802,117 $217 26% 2.95

FY 09

SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 15 15 0 66,597 66,597 0 100% $2,394,937 $3,878,706 $58 62% 2.73

YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF ALL WINDSTORM SALVAGE SALES FOR

∞  If marked, all or part of this sale is certified under Forest Stewardship Council Certificate No. BV-FM/COC-080501
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FSC REGION
∞

$0.00 #DIV/0!
$0.00 #DIV/0!

Notes:
1. Volumes are listed only in the following chart.  Forest Improvement Treatment sales are silvicultural activities and the volume is not part of the sustainable harvest or similar targets.

December 15-19, 2008

Delivered Values

NET 
$/MBF

TREATMENT           
ACRES

VOLUME 
OFFERED 

(MBF)

TOTAL 
APPRAISED 
PRICE /MBF

AGREEMENT

Stumpage Determination (Projected)

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Forest Improvement Treatment Sales Results

TOTAL        
COSTS REVENUENAME OF SALE COUNTY

$0.00

TOTAL BID 
PRICE /MBF 

TOTAL BID 
PRICE 

$0.00

∞  If marked, all or part of this sale is certified under Forest Stewardship Council Certificate No. BV-FM/COC-080501
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DECEMBER 2008

SALES SALES VOLUME TREATMENT
OFFERED SOLD OFFERED ACRES

TOTALS 0 0 0 0 0

FY 09

SALES SALES VOLUME TREATMENT
OFFERED SOLD OFFERED ACRES

TOTALS 1 1 0 1,500 1500 351

* Bid prices are converted from delivered value to stumpage based upon estimated costs, at the time of auction

SUMMARY OF FOREST IMPROVEMENT TREATMENT (FIT) SALES

SALES NOT 
AWARDED VOLUME  SOLD

YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF FOREST IMPROVEMENT TREATMENT (FIT) SALES 

SALES NOT 
AWARDED VOLUME  SOLD

, p p
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