DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Board Sales Results
August 25-28, 2008

VOLUME
AGREEMENT |FSC NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT
oo MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER
80503 Buckhorn Thinning & CC Cowlitz PC 5,361 $330,000 $497,746.70 $92.85 51% 2 Northwest Log Marketing, Inc.
82099 School Board Cowlitz PC 3,556 $596,000 $688,485.00 $193.61 16% 3 Georgia-Pacific West, Inc.
81948 Cavalier G. Hrbr/Thurs. PC 3,814 $794,000 $1,167,163.00 $306.02 47% 4 D R Johnson Lumber Company
82070 Ghouda Grays Harbor PC 5,432 $1,070,000 NO BIDS
81311 Typo Pacific PC 7,502 $334,000 $382,969.10 $51.05 15% 4 Quinault Logging
81892 Riggin Fit Pacific PC 10,870 $324,000 $413,140.40 $38.01 28% 4 Rayonier Forest Operations, LLC
82143 Sawzall Pacific PC 3,944 $689,000 NO BIDS
81714 Summer Jenny Skagit NW 1,958 $425,000 $747,318.67 $381.67 76% 4 Seattle-Snohomish Mill Company, Inc.
81879 Small Chip Snohomish NW 3,667 $912,000 $1,256,507.00 $342.65 38% 4 Sierra Pacific Industries
81711 Mayflower Whatcom NW 2,677 $517,000 NO BIDS
81824 Tall Boy Whatcom NW 4,513 $1,269,000 $1,426,514.00 $316.09 12% 3 Miller Shingle Co., Inc.
SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES AUGUST 2008
SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES IMBF OVER BIDS
TOTALS 11 8 3 53,294 41,241 18,979 7% $4,984,000 $6,579,844 $160 32% 3.50
YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES FY 09
SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES IMBF OVER BIDS
TOTALS 18 14 4 76,983 62,100 14,883 81% $8,935,000 $11,974,588 $193 34% 4.14

« |If marked, this sale is certified under Forest Stewardship Council Certificate No. BV-FM/COC-080501

Department of Natural Resources, information subject to changes and amendments over time.
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DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Region Sales Results
August 25-28, 2008

VOLUME
AGREEMENT [FSC NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT
00 MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER
83250 Cayuse Fire Salvage Okanogan NE 357 $22,770 $47,051.10 $131.80 107% 3 Boise Building Solutions, Marketing, LLC
81250 Deer Flat PC VDT Snohomish NW 2,372 $65,000 NO BIDS
83259 Fallen Prince Blowndown Salvage Stevens NE 244 $25,695 $44,864.29 $183.87 75% 1 Boise Building Solutions, Marketing, LLC
SUMMARY OF REGION SALES AUGUST 2008
SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES IMBF OVER BIDS
TOTALS 3 2 1 2,973 601 2,372 20% $48,465 $91,915 $153 90% 2.00
YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF REGION SALES FY 09
SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES IMBF OVER BIDS
TOTALS 9 7 2 7,703 5,299 2,404 69% $553,465 $792,672 $150 43% 2.43
SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGION SALES AUGUST 2008
SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES IMBF OVER BIDS
TOTALS 14 10 4 56,267 41,842 21,351 74% $5,032,465 $6,671,759 $159 33% 3.20
YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGION SALES FY 09
SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES IMBF OVER BIDS
TOTALS 27 21 6 84,686 67,399 17,287 80% $9,488,465 $12,767,260 $189 35% 3.57

o |If marked, this sale is certified under Forest Stewardship Council Certificate No. BV-FM/COC-080501

Department of Natural Resources, information subject to changes and amendments over time.
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DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

Windstorm 2007 Salvage Sales Results

August 25-28, 2008

VOLUME
AGREEMENT | FSC COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF
0 NAME OF SALE (MBF) BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS |APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
82613 BABE BD Grays Harbor PC 1,261 $76,000 $139,742.64 $110.82 84% 7 Murphy Company
82222 WAHOO BD Pacific PC 4,769 $204,000 $276,455.59 $57.97 36% 3 Sierra Pacific Industries
82224 JOHNSONS LANDING BD Pacific PC 673 $23,000 $30,964.61 $46.01 35% 3 Sierra Pacific Industries
82231 SHREDDED WHEAT BD Pacific PC 2,023 $91,000 $254,321.43 $125.71 179% 5 Northwest Log Marketing, Inc.
82259 NOT RUBY BD Pacific PC 1,770 $57,000 $113,735.00 $64.26 100% 4 Rayonier Forest Operations, LLC
82570 DONKEY PUNCHER BD Pacific PC 5,289 $188,000 $324,277.38 $61.31 72% 4 Sierra Pacific Industries
82600 BACK DOOR BD Pacific PC 1,279 $39,000 $52,654.00 $41.17 35% 3 Sierra Pacific Industries
Rue Creek Blowdown Sorts Pacific PC 10,832 $168,937 $492,363.67 $45.45 191% 1.9 See chart, page #4
* Contract Harvesting Sort; bid values converted from delivered value to estimated stumpage rate.
SUMMARY OF WINDSTORM SALVAGE SALES FOR THE MONTH OF AUGUST 2008
SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES IMBF OVER BIDS
TOTALS 8 8 0 27,896 27,896 0 100% $846,937 $1,684,514 $60 99% 3.9
YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF WINDSTORM SALVAGE SALES FOR FY 09
SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES IMBF OVER BIDS
TOTALS 15 15 0 66,597 66,597 0 100% $2,394,937 $3,878,706 $58 62% 2.7
SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD, REGION AND SALVAGE SALES FOR THE MONTH OF AUGUST 2008
SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES IMBF OVER BIDS
TOTALS 22 18 4 84,163 69,738 21,351 83% $5,879,402 $8,356,274 $120 42% 1.7
YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD, REGION AND SALVAGE SALES FOR FY 09
SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES IMBF OVER BIDS
TOTALS 42 36 6 151,283 133,996 17,287 89% $11,883,402 $16,645,966 $124 40% 3.2

o If marked, this sale is certified under Forest Stewardship Council Certificate No. BV-FM/COC-080501

Department of Natural Resources, information subject to changes and amendments over time.
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DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

SORT Sales Results (By Sale)

August 25-28, 2008

Delivered Values

Stumpage Determination (Projected)

VOLUME MINIMUM BID TOTAL TOTAL
AGREEMENT |FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED BID/ MBF PRICE/ MBF MINIMUM PRICE PRICE NUMBER OF
0 MBF (Delivered) (Delivered) BID BID /MBF BIDS APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
82615 RUE CREEK BD PHASE 2 Sort #11 6225 $319.00 $336.68 ($136,307.08) $255,826.96 $41.10 3 Sierra Pacific Industries
82616 RUE CREEK BD PHASE 2 Sort #12 1930 $279.00 $291.45 $80,401.67 $93,941.57 $48.67 3 Sierra Pacific Industries
82617 RUE CREEK BD PHASE 2 Sort #13 597 $320.00 $345.60 $35,385.64 $47,074.84 $78.85 2 Sierra Pacific Industries
82618 RUE CREEK BD PHASE 2 Sort #14 335 $393.00 $395.00 $56,177.55 $55,117.95 $164.53 2 Sierra Pacific Industries
82619 RUE CREEK BD PHASE 2 Sort #15 51 $316.00 $400.00 $5,605.50 $8,328.90 $163.31 1 Mason County Forest Products
82620 RUE CREEK BD PHASE 2 Sort #16 50 $873.00 $30,659.16 NO BIDS
82622 RUE CREEK BD PHASE 2 Sort #17 1111 $324.00 $325.80 $69,123.66 $30,923.66 $27.83 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.
82623 RUE CREEK BD PHASE 2 Sort #18 58 $288.00 $304.00 $3,986.86 $2,270.06 $39.14 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc.
82624 RUE CREEK BD PHASE 2 Sort #19 525 $299.00 $361.00 $12,396.53 ($1,120.27) ($2.13) 2 Stimson Lumber Company
82625 RUE CREEK BD PHASE 2 Sort #20 57 $467.00 $11,507.30 NO BIDS
10,832 $168,936.79 $492,363.67 $45.45 1.9

Department of Natural Resources, information subject to changes and amendments over time.
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