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VOLUME
AGREEMENT FSC REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

∞ MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
83200 Clallam OLY 5,288 $518,000 $1,309,348.00 $247.61 153% 2
83265 Clark PC 4,204 $800,000
83883 Clark PC 6,452 $933,000 $1,072,838.00 $166.28 15% 1
84261 Clark PC 5,395 $585,000 $1,195,955.68 $221.68 104% 7
84058 Cowlitz PC 2,403 $538,000 $601,000.00 $250.10 12% 1
84317 Cowlitz PC 3,617 $596,000 $1,062,489.58 $293.75 78% 9
83015 ∞ Grays Harbor/ Thurston PC 9,429 $1,541,000 $1,764,070.36 $187.09 14% 4
83024 Lewis PC 3,430 $328,000 $420,457.85 $122.58 28% 3
83252 Skagit NW 3,490 $290,000 $393,032.00 $112.62 36% 2
83905 Snohomish SPS 5,136 $643,000 $1,271,908.63 $247.65 98% 4
84213 Stevens NE 3,423 $273,425 $305,368.06 $89.21 12% 1.3
84327 Thurston PC 3,423 $500,000 $755,143.00 $220.61 51% 6
82779 Whatcom NW 3,062 $490,000 $528,672.70 $172.66 8% 2

 AUGUST 2009 FY 10

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 13 12 0 1 58,752 54,548 4,204 93% $7,235,425 $10,680,284 $196 48% 3.52

FY 10

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 22 21 0 1 108,821 104,617 4,204 96% $12,941,425 $19,680,221 $188 52% 3.78

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 

Thor Merrill & Ring Forest Products, LP

* Contract Harvesting Sort; bid values converted from delivered value to estimated stumpage rate.
∞  If marked, all or part of this sale is certified under Forest Stewardship Council Certificate No. BV-FM/COC-080501

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
Board Sales Results
August 11-27, 2009

NO BIDS
Remington Steele Interfor Pacific, Inc.
Power Out

NAME OF SALE COUNTY APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

Something Else Merrill & Ring Forest Products, LP

Deep Duff Hampton Tree Farms, Inc.

Berry Nice Simpson Lumber Company, LLC
Slide Divide Tim Brown Logging, Inc.
Chicken Little Merrill & Ring Forest Products, LP

Sugaree VRH & VDT Sierra Pacific Industries

Jupe Thinning Brintech, Inc.
Snowline Sierra Pacific Industries
Maggie May Seattle-Snohomish Mill Co., Inc.
Rogers Mountain Sorts See Chart on Page 4
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VOLUME
AGREEMENT FSC REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF

∞ MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS
84302 Clallam OLY 1,237 $94,000 $184,270.00 $148.97 96% 3
84553 Clallam OLY 278 $41,000
81286 Grays Harbor OLY 2,827 $101,000 $349,837.56 $123.75 246% 4
84498 Grays Harbor PC 211 $34,000 $40,150.00 $190.28 18% 4
84300 Jefferson OLY 1,125 $100,000 $181,938.00 $161.72 82% 7
82123 Whatcom NW 2,003 $166,000 $179,831.00 $89.78 8% 2

 AUGUST 2009

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 6 5 0 1 7,681 7,192 278 94% $461,000 $936,027 $130 103% 4.00

FY 10

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 9 8 0 1 12,544 12,266 278 98% $806,000 $1,476,473 $120 83% 4.50

AUGUST 2009

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 19 17 0 2 66,433 61,740 4,482 93% $7,696,425 $11,616,310 $188 51% 3.66

FY 10

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN. BID PRICE PRICE % AVG. #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS

TOTALS 31 29 0 2 121,365 116,883 4,482 96% $13,747,425 $21,156,694 $181 54% 3.98

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

Lost Sarr Sierra Pacific Industries

Majestic Railroad NO BIDS

Mainsail Allen Logging Company

Gold Member Blowdown Sierra Pacific Industries

∞  If marked, all or part of this sale is certified under Forest Stewardship Council Certificate No. BV-FM/COC-080501

SUMMARY OF REGION SALES

YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF REGION SALES

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGION SALES

YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGION SALES

Stock Pile Lewis River Logging & Exacavating

NAME OF SALE COUNTY APPARENT
HIGH BIDDER

High N Dry Munro, LLC

Region Sales Results
August 11-27, 2009
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FSC REGION
∞

84162 NE 1,620 $259.50 $307.53 $498,204.12 $437,436.71 $37.51 645

Notes:
1. Volumes are listed only in the following chart.  Forest Improvement Treatment sales are silvicultural activities and the volume is not part of the sustainable harvest or similar targets.

AUGUST 2009

SALES SALES VOLUME TREATMENT FIT SALES
OFFERED SOLD OFFERED ACRES PENDING

TOTALS 1 1 1,620 1,620 645 0

YEAR-TO-DATE SUMMARY OF FOREST IMPROVEMENT TREATMENT (FIT) SALES FY 10

SALES SALES VOLUME TREATMENT
OFFERED SOLD OFFERED ACRES

TOTALS 1 1 2,703 2,703 1,288

* Bid prices are converted from delivered value to stumpage based upon estimated costs, at the time of auction

Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected)

Forest Improvement Treatment Sales Results
August 11-27, 2009

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

AGREEMENT NAME OF SALE COUNTY
VOLUME 
OFFERED 

(MBF)

TOTAL 
APPRAISED 
PRICE /MBF

TOTAL BID 
PRICE /MBF 

TOTAL BID 
PRICE 

TOTAL             
COSTS REVENUE

Beetle Rock FIT Sorts Spokane $60,767.41

NET 
$/MBF

TREATMENT           
ACRES

0

∞  If marked, all or part of this sale is certified under Forest Stewardship Council Certificate No. BV-FM/COC-080501

SALES NOT AWARDED VOLUME  
SOLD

0

SALES NOT AWARDED VOLUME  
SOLD

SUMMARY OF FOREST IMPROVEMENT TREATMENT (FIT) SALES
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TOTAL TOTAL
AGREEMENT FSC MINIMUM BID MINIMUM PRICE PRICE

∞ BID/ MBF PRICE/ MBF BID BID /MBF
84393 $285.10 $318.49 $3,158.39 $15,516.23 $70.53 2
84394 $301.80 $311.38 $41,230.59 $48,773.59 $68.79 1
84395 $210.00 $267.78 ($30,597.43) ($19,988.98) -$42.62 1
84396 $283.50 $324.38 ($1,220.86) $990.44 $18.34 2
84397 $178.20 $382.50 ($5,918.67) $15,476.13 $92.12 3

$6,652.02 $60,767.41 $37.51 1.8

MINIMUM BID TOTAL TOTAL
FSC BID/ MBF PRICE/ MBF MINIMUM PRICE PRICE
∞ (Delivered) (Delivered) BID BID /MBF

84379 $303.00 $303.00 $42,303.27 $42,303.27 $97.47 1
84380 $297.00 $315.03 $81,606.23 $92,695.40 $99.14 2
84381 $248.00 $257.91 $116.34 ($1,854.57) ($9.81) 1
84382 $272.00 $272.00 $53,337.89 $53,337.89 $64.26 1
84383 $536.00 $612.74 $77,837.76 $94,387.86 $436.98 1
84384 $265.00 $273.00 $15,141.26 $21,441.26 $28.59 1
84385 $178.00 $247.50 $3,081.79 $3,056.95 $44.30 2

Sold Sort Totals $273,424.54 $305,368.06 $89.21 1.3

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
 SORT Sales Results (By Sale)

August 11-27, 2009

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

D
on

e

1,620

Beetle Rock FIT Sort #2 709 Boise Building Solutions, Marketing, LLC.
Beetle Rock FIT Sort #3 469 Boise White Paper, LLC
Beetle Rock FIT Sort #4 54 Vaagen Brothers Lumber, Inc.
Beetle Rock FIT Sort #5 168 Boise White Paper, LLC

Beetle Rock FIT Sort #1 220 Idaho Forest Group, LLC

FIT SORT Sales Results (By Sale)
August 11-27, 2009

NAME OF SALE OFFERED
MBF

Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected)

VOLUME
NUMBER OF 

BIDS APPARENT HIGH BIDDER

Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected)

AGREEMENT NAME OF SALE
VOLUME NUMBER OF 

BIDS APPARENT HIGH BIDDEROFFERED
MBF

3,423

D
on

e

Rogers Mountain Sort #1 434 Boise Building Solutions, Marketing, LLC.
Rogers Mountain Sort #2 935 Boise Building Solutions, Marketing, LLC.
Rogers Mountain Sort #3 189 Idaho Forest Group, LLC
Rogers Mountain Sort #4 830 Vaagen Brothers Lumber, Inc.
Rogers Mountain Sort #5 216 Columbia Cedar, Inc.
Rogers Mountain Sort #6 750 Vaagen Brothers Lumber, Inc.
Rogers Mountain Sort #7 69 Home Fires Wood Company
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