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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 April 2020 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 97938 PYRAMID PEAK Clallam OLY 10958 $1,660,000.00 $1,751,359.00 $159.82 6% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 99599 GROOT VRH THIN  Cowlitz PC 3491 $810,000.00 $1,139,235.60 $326.34 41% 3.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 RMZ 
 97286 DELINEATION Grays Harbor SP 7880 $2,556,000.00 $2,677,466.00 $339.78 5% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 99244 OLD MILLER Jefferson OLY 6331 $926,000.00 $1,076,000.00 $169.96 16% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 97375 WEBB VRH & WMZ Mason SP 2910 $855,000.00 $1,261,051.65 $433.35 47% 5.00 Stella-Jones Corporation 

 99630 Q SUMMIT Okanogan NE 3920 $443,000.00 $445,977.73 $113.77 1% 1.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 100004 HI VIZ Pacific PC 5400 $1,222,000.00 $1,454,062.00 $269.27 19% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 98120 Q YONCK SORTS Pend Oreille NE 5755 $1,320,033.78 $948,150.78 $164.74 -28% 1.43 See Sort Sales Results 
 99859 WABASH  Skagit NW 7778 $2,055,000.00 $3,404,494.67 $437.71 66% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 CANNONBALL  
 VRH RMZ 
 99598 TRANSYLVANIA  Skamania PC 5621 $2,814,138.29 Project Pending - See Sort Sales  
 SORTS Results 
 95800 Q WOODSPUR Stevens NE 6066 $929,000.00 $929,499.02 $153.23 0% 1.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 98885 BOLLARD Whatcom NW 2260 $806,000.00 $860,757.00 $380.87 7% 2.00 Nielsen Brothers, Inc. 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

April 2020 12 11 1 0 68,370 61,898 1,722 4,750 92% $13,199,912.78 $15,948,053.45 $257.65 21% 2.04 
YTD FY 2020 103 92 1 10 474,980 427,985 1,722 45,273 91% $101,015,394.57 $131,672,827.73 $307.66 30% 2.54  

 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

April 2020 12 11 1 0 68,370 61,898 1,722 4,750 92% $13,199,912.78 $15,948,053.45 $257.65 21% 2.04 
YTD FY 2020 107 96 1 10 480,640 433,645 1,722 45,273 91% $101,660,394.57 $132,654,533.81 $305.91 30% 2.54 
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DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 April 2020 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 100065 TRANSYLVANIA SORTS 1 1,511 $575.00 $609.01 $453,558.29 $504,947.40 $334.18 1 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 100066 TRANSYLVANIA SORTS 2 2,760 $600.00 $1,656,000.00 0 NO BIDS 
 100067 TRANSYLVANIA SORTS 3 1,049 $550.00 $576,950.00 0 NO BIDS 
 100069 TRANSYLVANIA SORTS 5 84 $475.00 $39,900.00 0 NO BIDS 
 100071 TRANSYLVANIA SORTS 7 114 $450.00 $450.00 $51,300.00 $51,300.00 $450.00 2 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 100072 TRANSYLVANIA SORTS 8 6 $850.00 $5,100.00 0 NO BIDS 
 100073 TRANSYLVANIA SORTS 9 46 $364.00 $442.00 $16,744.00 $20,332.00 $442.00 4 TH Logging, LLC 
 100074 TRANSYLVANIA SORTS 10  51 $286.00 $390.00 $14,586.00 $19,890.00 $390.00 4 TH Logging, LLC 
 100190 Q YONCK SORT 01 1,252 $402.00 $408.00 $233,859.97 $241,371.97 $192.79 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 100191 Q YONCK SORT 02 1,066 $400.00 $402.50 $169,869.75 $172,534.75 $161.85 1 Boise Cascade Wood Products,  
 LLC 
 100192 Q YONCK SORT 03 783 $378.15 $378.15 $122,832.52 $122,893.52 $156.95 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 100193 Q YONCK SORT 04 621 $397.46 $246,825.00 0 NO BIDS 
 100194 Q YONCK SORT 05 35 $299.43 $299.43 $1,343.66 $1,343.66 $38.39 2 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 100195 Q YONCK SORT 06 131 $351.76 $46,080.00 0 NO BIDS 
 100196 Q YONCK SORT 07 99 $901.17 $89,216.00 0 NO BIDS 
 100197 Q YONCK SORT 08 478 $800.72 $800.72 $303,026.68 $303,026.68 $633.95 3 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 100198 Q YONCK SORT 09 1,165 $319.96 $319.96 $107,926.58 $107,926.58 $92.64 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 
 100199 Q YONCK SORT 10 125 $225.00 $225.00 ($946.38) ($946.38) ($7.57) 1 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc. 


