

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
BOARD SALE RESULTS**

December 2019

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
99249		FALLS CREEK	Clallam	OLY	6432	\$961,000.00					NO BIDS
99018		PUMPKIN PATCH VRH & RMZ THIN	King	SP	3253	\$995,000.00	\$1,448,570.91	\$445.30	46%	6.00	Murphy Company
96855		UNIVERSITY FUNDS	Pacific	PC	2804	\$725,000.00	\$911,540.55	\$325.09	26%	3.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
98287		CHEESE BEAR	Pacific	PC	10621	\$3,153,000.00	\$3,189,405.00	\$300.29	1%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
98033		COPPERHEAD	Skagit	NW	3343	\$664,000.00					NO BIDS
98671		COOPERS CACHE	Skagit	NW	6450	\$1,952,000.00	\$2,139,333.00	\$331.68	10%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
97287	*	DILLYDALLY	Thurston	SP	7538	\$2,520,000.00	\$2,912,734.01	\$386.41	16%	2.00	Murphy Company
97289		THUNDERSTRUCK	Thurston	SP	10066	\$3,052,000.00	\$5,153,523.43	\$511.97	69%	4.00	Murphy Company
98447		GOOD BARK	Whatcom	NW	2892	\$854,000.00	\$1,121,605.78	\$387.83	31%	2.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
December 2019	9	7	0	2	53,399	43,624	0	9,775	82%	\$13,251,000.00	\$16,876,712.68	\$386.87	27%	3.00
YTD FY 2020	57	47	0	10	252,472	207,660	0	44,812	83%	\$46,628,162.56	\$60,929,000.06	\$293.41	31%	2.50

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
December 2019	9	7	0	2	53,399	43,624	0	9,775	82%	\$13,251,000.00	\$16,876,712.68	\$386.87	27%	3.00
YTD FY 2020	59	49	0	10	254,581	209,769	0	44,812	83%	\$46,981,162.56	\$61,443,067.44	\$292.91	31%	2.46

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)