
 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 November 2012 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 88396 TOP KING CREEK Clark PC 5918 $1,369,000.00 $1,906,966.00 $322.23 39% 3.00 Simpson Lumber Co., LLC 
 88684 SARATOGA Lewis PC 2900 $634,000.00 $733,978.00 $253.10 16% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 88370 ELK HOLLOW Pacific PC 2579 $579,000.00 $740,796.72 $287.24 28% 3.00 Manke Timber Company, Inc. 
 88732 ST. JOE SORTS Pacific PC 196 $32,711.28 $37,926.28 $193.50 16% 2.00 See Sort Sales Results 
 88456 BOSS HAWG Snohomish NW 9554 $2,011,000.00 $3,124,326.00 $327.02 55% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 88468 SKAGIT VALLEY  Snohomish NW 2763 $425,000.00 $916,830.40 $331.82 116% 4.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 VDT AND VRH 
 88567 * SHORT SORTS Thurston PC 2665 $722,252.30 $964,732.30 $362.00 34% 2.20 See Sort Sales Results 
 88303 SNIPPETS Whatcom NW 5822 $1,380,000.00 $1,923,969.00 $330.47 39% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

November 2012 8 8 0 0 32,397 32,397 0 0 100% $7,152,963.58 $10,349,524.70 $319.46 45% 2.40 
YTD FY 2013 38 34 0 4 159,882 144,175 0 15,707 90% $29,090,016.89 $41,413,723.81 $287.25 42% 2.55  
 
 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 88346 C-1200 THINNING Jefferson Ol 3108 $136,000.00 $143,803.70 $46.27 6% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 88767 DRAPER SPRINGS  Klickitat SE 110 $4,000.00 $4,660.60 $42.37 17% 3.00 Hegerberg Timber Services LLC 
 DEUX 
 88417 * ALDER A LA  Pierce SP 563 $115,000.00 $131,503.00 $233.58 14% 2.00 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 CARTE VRH &  
 VDT 
 89140 ODE TO JOY Snohomish NW 305 $52,000.00 $52,054.68 $170.67 0% 1.00 Hampton Tree Farms, Inc. 
 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

November 2012 4 4 0 0 4,086 4,086 0 0 100% $307,000.00 $332,021.98 $81.26 8% 2.00 
YTD FY 2013 6 6 0 0 6,008 6,008 0 0 100% $548,000.00 $607,657.23 $101.14 11% 2.00 

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

November 2012 12 12 0 0 36,483 36,483 0 0 100% $7,459,963.58 $10,681,546.68 $292.78 43% 2.27 
YTD FY 2013 44 40 0 4 165,890 150,183 0 15,707 91% $29,638,016.89 $42,021,381.04 $279.80 42% 2.47 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 November 2012 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 88568 * SHORT SORT 1 74 $412.57 $484.65 $23,333.50 $28,667.60 $387.40 3 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 88569 * SHORT SORT 2 726 $480.00 $560.00 $195,620.70 $253,700.70 $349.45 3 Simpson Lumber Co., LLC 
 88570 * SHORT SORT 3 710 $475.00 $475.50 $187,759.50 $188,114.50 $264.95 2 Buse Timber & Sales, Inc. 
 88571 * SHORT SORT 4 211 $450.00 $638.77 $50,523.95 $90,354.42 $428.22 3 Manke Timber Company, Inc. 
 88572 * SHORT SORT 5 594 $525.00 $715.00 $186,783.30 $299,643.30 $504.45 4 Canyon Lumber Company, Inc. 
 88573 * SHORT SORT 6 131 $510.00 $619.95 $39,227.95 $53,631.40 $409.40 2 Cascade Hardwoods, Inc. 
 88574 * SHORT SORT 7 122 $400.00 $468.59 $23,112.90 $31,480.88 $258.04 2 Cascade Hardwoods, Inc. 
 88575 * SHORT SORT 8 10 $625.00 $950.00 $4,144.50 $7,394.50 $739.45 1 Welco Lumber Co., Inc. 
 88576 * SHORT SORT 9 28 $207.14 $207.00 $3,784.00 $3,780.00 $135.00 1 JKCK Resources, Inc. 
 88577 * SHORT SORT 10 59 $206.95 $207.00 $7,962.00 $7,965.00 $135.00 1 JKCK Resources, Inc. 
 88740 ST. JOE SORT 8 196 $380.10 $406.71 $32,711.28 $37,926.28 $193.50 2 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 


