
Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501) 

 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 October 2016 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 93925 ELLIS CROSSING  Clallam Ol 1381 $138,000.00 $138,541.70 $100.32 0% 1.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 VDT VRH 
 92221 CAMP DRAPER Klickitat SE 2692 $211,000.00 $441,735.48 $164.09 109% 6.00 High Cascade, Inc. 
 93931 OH HENRIE Pacific PC 3015 $779,000.00 $1,072,102.00 $355.59 38% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 92941 * SNIKERS Pierce SP 2738 $764,000.00 $965,670.70 $352.69 26% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 88892 ON TIME VRH&VDT  Thurston SP 3000 $639,000.00 $1,112,007.97 $370.67 74% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 93178 SILVER SLIVER Wahkiakum PC 2941 $710,000.00 $870,194.00 $295.88 23% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 93613 UPPER DOAKS Whatcom NW 1587 $400,000.00 $509,354.77 $320.95 27% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

October 2016 7 7 0 0 17,354 17,354 0 0 100% $3,641,000.00 $5,109,606.62 $294.43 40% 2.86 
YTD FY 2017 25 25 0 0 79,386 79,386 0 0 100% $17,710,187.25 $24,141,877.42 $304.11 36% 2.67   

 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

October 2016 7 7 0 0 17,354 17,354 0 0 100% $3,641,000.00 $5,109,606.62 $294.43 40% 2.86 
YTD FY 2017 25 25 0 0 79,386 79,386 0 0 100% $17,710,187.25 $24,141,877.42 $304.11 36% 2.67 


