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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 November 2016 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 93647 KARI MAKWA  Clallam Ol 3856 $1,239,967.41 $1,490,676.41 $386.59 20% 1.69 See Sort Sales Results 
 SORTS 
 93926 DICKEY MOUNTAIN Clallam Ol 7052 $1,051,000.00 $1,099,187.00 $155.87 5% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 

 94070 COAL CALAMITY Clallam Ol 541 $98,000.00 $119,418.50 $220.74 22% 3.00 Munro, LLC 
 93329 MOONSTER Clark PC 4915 $1,273,000.00 NO BIDS 
 93596 HAVARTI SORTS Clark PC 6308 $2,052,980.88 $2,653,025.55 $420.58 29% 2.57 See Sort Sales Results 
 93330 DEER CREEK Cowlitz PC 3454 $788,000.00 $1,107,954.69 $320.77 41% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 93559 TIMBER TIGER Cowlitz PC 4585 $986,000.00 $988,692.20 $215.64 0% 1.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 93887 SKULLET Cowlitz PC 5943 $2,162,000.00 $3,282,037.40 $552.25 52% 4.00 Herbert Lumber Company 
 93253 RAMS HORN VRH  Grays Harbor,  SP 8078 $1,838,000.00 $2,668,933.33 $330.40 45% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 & VDT Thurston 
 93711 RED OCTOPUS Jefferson Ol 3825 $711,000.00 $810,527.00 $211.90 14% 2.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 94153 RAINFOREST Jefferson Ol 5031 $844,000.00 $932,568.00 $185.36 10% 2.00 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 93067 KERSWOP King SP 2426 $719,000.00 $925,104.00 $381.33 29% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 93631 SILVER CHARM Lewis PC 2770 $930,000.00 $1,474,890.00 $532.45 59% 7.00 Western Timber, Inc. 
 93569 HOOSIER VRH &  Skagit NW 5530 $1,635,000.00 $2,423,740.00 $438.29 48% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 VDT 
 93731 SUMMER BREEZE Snohomish NW 4305 $1,394,000.00 $2,194,180.00 $509.68 57% 5.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 93486 JUMPIN JACK Snohomish, Skagit NW 5725 $1,371,000.00 $1,682,837.48 $293.95 23% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

November 2016 16 15 0 1 74,344 69,429 0 4,915 93% $17,819,948.29 $23,853,771.56 $343.57 34% 2.82 
YTD FY 2017 41 40 0 1 153,730 148,815 0 4,915 97% $35,530,135.54 $47,995,648.98 $322.52 35% 2.73 
  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

November 2016 16 15 0 1 74,344 69,429 0 4,915 93% $17,819,948.29 $23,853,771.56 $343.57 34% 2.82 
YTD FY 2017 41 40 0 1 153,730 148,815 0 4,915 97% $35,530,135.54 $47,995,648.98 $322.52 35% 2.73  
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 November 2016 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 93597 HAVARTI SORT 1 213 $440.00 $732.88 $30,697.62 $93,081.06 $437.00 2 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 93598 HAVARTI SORT 2 449 $525.00 $678.85 $123,614.31 $192,692.96 $429.16 3 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 93599 HAVARTI SORT 3 1,332 $560.00 $678.41 $448,258.33 $605,980.45 $454.94 4 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 93600 HAVARTI SORT 4 1,751 $540.00 $570.00 $591,803.47 $644,333.47 $367.98 3 Stimson Lumber Company, Inc. 
 93601 HAVARTI SORT 5 322 $600.00 $710.00 $116,708.99 $152,128.99 $472.45 4 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 93602 HAVARTI SORT 6 1,222 $600.00 $720.00 $470,311.48 $616,951.48 $504.87 5 Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC 
 93603 HAVARTI SORT 7 292 $600.00 $760.00 $93,203.56 $139,923.56 $479.19 4 Canyon Lumber Company, Inc. 
 93604 HAVARTI SORT 8 195 $600.00 $606.71 $74,010.35 $75,318.80 $386.25 1 Northwest Hardwoods, Inc. 
 93605 HAVARTI SORT 9 71 $425.00 $485.39 $12,447.03 $16,734.72 $235.70 3 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 93606 HAVARTI SORT 10 168 $425.00 $513.24 $33,857.09 $48,681.41 $289.77 2 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC. 
 93607 HAVARTI SORT 11 33 $325.00 $325.00 $175.24 $175.24 $5.31 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 
 93608 HAVARTI SORT 12 90 $338.00 $338.00 $1,647.92 $1,647.92 $18.31 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 
 93609 HAVARTI SORT 13 4 $325.00 $325.00 $21.24 $21.24 $5.31 1 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 
 93610 HAVARTI SORT 14 166 $720.00 $775.00 $56,224.25 $65,354.25 $393.70 2 Bell Timber, Inc. 
 94216 KARI MAKWA SORT 01 122 $700.00 $700.00 $35,319.44 $35,319.44 $289.50 2 McFarland Cascade Holdings, Inc. 
 94217 KARI MAKWA SORT 02 108 $525.00 $540.00 $32,304.27 $33,924.27 $314.11 1 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 94218 KARI MAKWA SORT 03 1,618 $670.00 $765.00 $581,320.81 $735,030.81 $454.28 3 Canyon Lumber Company, Inc. 
 94219 KARI MAKWA SORT 04 623 $525.00 $540.00 $186,347.75 $195,692.75 $314.11 1 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 94220 KARI MAKWA SORT 05 377 $575.00 $576.25 $132,701.57 $133,172.82 $353.24 3 Georgia Pacific WFS, LLC 
 94221 KARI MAKWA SORT 06 367 $500.00 $536.00 $91,637.54 $104,849.54 $285.69 1 Buse Timber & Sales, Inc. 
 94222 KARI MAKWA SORT 07 136 $1,050.00 $1,500.00 $93,267.92 $154,467.92 $1,135.79 2 Columbia Cedar, Inc. 
 94223 KARI MAKWA SORT 08 189 $425.00 $425.00 $38,157.88 $38,157.88 $201.89 1 Interfor U.S., Inc. 
 94224 KARI MAKWA SORT 09 148 $460.00 $513.00 $19,564.65 $27,408.65 $185.19 1 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 94225 KARI MAKWA SORT 10 57 $625.00 $670.00 $22,785.38 $25,350.38 $444.74 2 Port Angeles Hardwood, LLC 
 94226 KARI MAKWA SORT 11 39 $400.00 $405.00 $4,748.78 $4,943.78 $126.76 2 Port Angeles Hardwood, LLC 
 94227 KARI MAKWA SORT 12 33 $216.00 $227.25 $991.11 $1,362.36 $41.28 1 Evergreen Fibre 
 94228 KARI MAKWA SORT 13 39 $207.00 $211.50 $820.31 $995.81 $25.53 2 Evergreen Fibre 


