

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
BOARD SALE RESULTS**

March 2017

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
93634		MAY DAY	Clallam	OI	3007	\$739,000.00	\$857,487.00	\$285.16	16%	2.00	Interfor U.S., Inc.
94160		CLALLAM COLLECTIVE SORTS	Clallam	OI	5790	\$1,384,036.78	\$1,501,565.16	\$259.34	8%	1.64	See Sort Sales Results
94012		PROVOLONE	Clark	PC	3978	\$1,276,000.00	\$1,484,818.00	\$373.26	16%	3.00	Interfor U.S., Inc.
94075		TOP FOX	Clark	PC	3939	\$931,000.00	\$1,341,879.00	\$340.66	44%	2.00	Interfor U.S., Inc.
94683		RALLY CAR	Clark	PC	2094	\$419,000.00	\$748,074.00	\$357.25	79%	2.00	Cascade Hardwood, LLC
93219		EXPLORATION	Grays Harbor	SP	6189	\$2,048,000.00	\$2,533,155.44	\$409.30	24%	4.00	Murphy Company
93259		BURNT ENDS	Grays Harbor	SP	2654	\$796,000.00	\$971,141.00	\$365.92	22%	3.00	Cascade Hardwood, LLC
94595		NORTH WILLIAMS	Grays Harbor	PC	7265	\$2,212,000.00	\$2,460,315.00	\$338.65	11%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
94509		KALALOCH	Jefferson	OI	2315	\$479,000.00	\$762,677.00	\$329.45	59%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
94752		MATHINNER	Jefferson	OI	4638	\$561,000.00	\$805,445.96	\$173.66	44%	3.00	Northwest Log Marketing, Inc.
94429		GEM TWIST	Lewis	PC	5466	\$1,992,000.00	\$2,587,129.78	\$473.31	30%	4.00	Columbia Vista Corporation
93587		CORNMEAL VDT & VRH	Skagit	NW	1901	\$570,000.00	\$694,740.64	\$365.46	22%	2.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
93667		ACES WILD	Skagit	NW	1787	\$679,000.00	\$829,948.78	\$464.44	22%	6.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
94692		WILD CARD	Skagit	NW	3782	\$1,440,000.00	\$1,699,113.30	\$449.26	18%	4.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
93864		DANCING BEAR VDT & VRH	Snohomish	NW	1826	\$202,000.00	\$252,677.28	\$138.38	25%	1.00	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
92723		NINEBARK SORTS	Stevens	NE	4368	\$1,598,455.91	\$1,933,150.15	\$442.57	21%	2.33	See Sort Sales Results
93940		UNCLE WALT	Whatcom	NW	2309	\$625,000.00	\$1,007,535.00	\$436.35	61%	3.00	Sierra Pacific Industries

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
March 2017	17	17	0	0	63,308	63,308	0	0	100%	\$17,951,492.69	\$22,470,852.49	\$354.94	25%	2.76
YTD FY 2017	93	92	0	1	355,907	355,314	0	593	100%	\$92,495,388.31	\$122,125,839.83	\$343.71	32%	2.76

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
March 2017	17	17	0	0	63,308	63,308	0	0	100%	\$17,951,492.69	\$22,470,852.49	\$354.94	25%	2.76
YTD FY 2017	93	92	0	1	355,907	355,314	0	593	100%	\$92,495,388.31	\$122,125,839.83	\$343.71	32%	2.76

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES

SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale)

March 2017

AGREE- MENT	FSC	NAME OF SALE	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	Delivered Values		Stumpage Determination (Projected)			# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
				MINIMUM BID / MBF	BID PRICE / MBF	TOTAL MINIMUM BID	TOTAL BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF		
94381		KLINES MEADOW FIT SORT 01	841	\$410.00	\$448.50	\$68,609.50	\$100,988.00	\$120.08	2	Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC
94382		KLINES MEADOW FIT SORT 02	1,258	\$402.00	\$468.48	\$34,278.89	\$117,910.73	\$93.73	3	Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.
94383		KLINES MEADOW FIT SORT 03	354	\$334.83	\$410.54	(\$31,912.58)	(\$5,111.63)	(\$14.44)	2	IFG Timber, LLC
94384		KLINES MEADOW FIT SORT 04	434	\$349.77	\$375.74	(\$8,176.29)	\$3,093.71	\$7.13	1	IFG Timber, LLC
94385		KLINES MEADOW FIT SORT 05	180	\$1,201.20	\$1,399.99	\$156,265.94	\$192,048.50	\$1,066.94	3	Alta Forest Products, LLC
94386		KLINES MEADOW FIT SORT 06	1,012	\$320.01	\$332.81	(\$78,192.55)	(\$65,238.55)	(\$64.46)	1	Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.
94387		KLINES MEADOW FIT SORT 07	158	\$150.00	\$175.50	\$6,906.99	\$10,935.99	\$69.22	2	Home Fires Wood Company
94388		KLINES MEADOW FIT SORT 08	101	\$225.00	\$288.00	(\$7,397.00)	(\$1,034.00)	(\$10.24)	2	Home Fires Wood Company
94410		WILD PLUM SORT 1	1,827	\$525.02	\$631.15	\$86,909.49	\$280,806.94	\$153.70	3	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
94411		WILD PLUM SORT 2	718	\$600.00	\$620.00	\$271,951.95	\$286,311.95	\$398.76	5	Rainier Veneer, Inc.
94412		WILD PLUM SORT 3	359	\$350.00	\$536.06	\$47,545.37	\$114,340.91	\$318.50	2	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
94413		WILD PLUM SORT 4	40	\$405.00		\$16,200.00			0	NO BIDS
94414		WILD PLUM SORT 5	358	\$207.00	\$216.00	(\$24,762.00)	(\$21,540.00)	(\$60.17)	2	JKCK Resources, Inc.
94494		CLALLAM COLLECTIVE SORT 1	923	\$570.00	\$585.00	\$294,814.47	\$308,659.47	\$334.41	3	Georgia Pacific WFS, LLC
94495		CLALLAM COLLECTIVE SORT 2	864	\$570.00	\$600.00	\$298,718.46	\$324,638.46	\$375.74	2	Interfor U.S., Inc.
94496		CLALLAM COLLECTIVE SORT 3	31	\$1,050.00	\$1,051.00	\$22,195.97	\$22,226.97	\$717.00	1	Alta Forest Products, LLC
94497		CLALLAM COLLECTIVE SORT 4	1,556	\$500.00	\$543.48	\$190,608.37	\$258,263.25	\$165.98	1	Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
94498		CLALLAM COLLECTIVE SORT 5	1,563	\$520.00	\$520.00	\$462,239.99	\$462,239.99	\$295.74	2	Interfor U.S., Inc.
94499		CLALLAM COLLECTIVE SORT 6	288	\$410.00	\$410.00	\$28,719.06	\$28,719.06	\$99.72	1	Alta Forest Products, LLC
94500		CLALLAM COLLECTIVE SORT 7	172	\$370.00	\$370.00	\$4,831.30	\$4,831.30	\$28.09	1	Alta Forest Products, LLC
94501		CLALLAM COLLECTIVE SORT 8	158	\$690.00	\$721.00	\$73,703.67	\$78,601.67	\$497.48	2	Northwest Hardwoods, Inc.
94502		CLALLAM COLLECTIVE SORT 9	125	\$225.00	\$254.34	(\$91.38)	\$3,576.12	\$28.61	1	Evergreen Fibre
94503		CLALLAM COLLECTIVE SORT 10	56	\$225.00	\$252.00	(\$25.82)	\$1,486.18	\$26.54	2	Port Angeles Hardwood, LLC
94647		COOGANS BLUFF FIT SORT 03	988	\$320.04	\$320.04	(\$155,026.25)	(\$155,026.25)	(\$156.91)	1	Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.
94648		COOGANS BLUFF FIT SORT 04	29	\$297.38		\$1,942.23			0	NO BIDS
94829		NINEBARK SORT 01	436	\$410.00	\$444.00	\$105,826.88	\$120,650.88	\$276.72	2	Boise Cascade Wood Products, LLC
94830		NINEBARK SORT 02	260	\$402.00	\$468.48	\$62,899.77	\$80,184.57	\$308.40	3	Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.
94831		NINEBARK SORT 03	778	\$334.76	\$359.63	\$132,578.68	\$151,928.68	\$195.28	2	Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.
94832		NINEBARK SORT 04	973	\$349.81	\$375.78	\$156,360.08	\$181,629.38	\$186.67	1	IFG Timber, LLC
94833		NINEBARK SORT 05	198	\$1,200.92	\$1,649.62	\$209,965.40	\$298,807.40	\$1,509.13	3	Bell Timber, Inc.
94834		NINEBARK SORT 06	803	\$1,201.13	\$1,399.91	\$822,460.24	\$982,081.18	\$1,223.02	3	Alta Forest Products, LLC
94835		NINEBARK SORT 07	596	\$319.88	\$332.77	\$90,174.24	\$97,852.24	\$164.18	2	Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.
94836		NINEBARK SORT 08	285	\$150.00	\$150.00	\$16,661.73	\$16,661.73	\$58.46	2	Home Fires Wood Company
94837		NINEBARK SORT 09	39	\$225.00	\$271.80	\$1,528.89	\$3,354.09	\$86.00	3	Ponderay Newsprint Company
95111		CLALLAM COLLECTIVE SORT 11	54	\$375.00	\$375.00	\$8,322.69	\$8,322.69	\$154.12	2	Port Angeles Hardwood, LLC

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
FOREST IMPROVEMENT TREATMENT SALES RESULTS**

March 2017

NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	TREATMENT ACRES	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	Delivered Values		Stumpage Determination (Projected)	
					TOTAL MINIMUM BID	TOTAL BID PRICE	TOTAL REVENUE	NET \$ / MBF
WILD PLUM SORTS	Kittitas	SE	528	3,302	\$1,605,966.00	\$1,868,040.99	\$659,919.80	\$199.85
KLINES MEADOW FIT SORTS	Stevens	NE	821	4,338	\$1,707,347.00	\$1,920,556.85	\$353,592.75	\$81.51
	PROJECTS OFFERED	PROJECTS AWARDED	NOT AWARDED	TREATMENT ACRES	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME AWARDED		
March 2017	2	2	0	1,349	7,640	7,600		
YTD FY 2017	2	2	0	1,349	7,640	7,600		