
Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time 
* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
BOARD SALE RESULTS 

June 2017

VOLUME
AGREEMENT FSC®  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 

 MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

94937 TONATA FH Ferry, Okanogan NE 2439 $333,000.00 $445,641.30 $182.71 34% 1.00 Vaagen Bros. Lumber, Inc.
94975 BIG WISHKAH Grays Harbor OLY 991 $270,000.00 $360,676.00 $363.95 34% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries
94077 * GALE FORCE King SP 4843 $723,000.00 $1,155,911.00 $238.68 60% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries
93859 BEARLY THERE Skagit NW 4415 $786,000.00 $1,391,129.83 $315.09 77% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries
94693 SANDHILL VDT & Skagit NW 3617 $673,000.00 $700,627.95 $193.70 4% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.

VRH 
94736 BIG BEND Snohomish NW 3753 $1,332,000.00 $1,588,348.16 $423.22 19% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, LLC.
93612 BLUE SKY VDT Whatcom NW 3993 $776,000.00 $790,934.35 $198.08 2% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries

VRH RMZ 
94599 TWAYBLADE SWT Whatcom NW 593 $45,000.00 NO BIDS

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

June 2017 8 7 0 1 24,644 24,051 0 593 98% $4,893,000.00 $6,433,268.59 $267.48 31% 1.71
YTD FY 2017 128 127 0 1 522,382 521,789 0 593 100% $132,731,538.00 $176,913,449.07 $339.05 33% 2.62 

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG #
OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

June 2017 8 7 0 1 24,644 24,051 0 593 98% $4,893,000.00 $6,433,268.59 $267.48 31% 1.71
YTD FY 2017 128 127 0 1 522,382 521,789 0 593 100% $132,731,538.00 $176,913,449.07 $339.05 33% 2.62


