
 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 

 January 2012 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 86131 SOUTHWEST  Clallam Ol 6266 $1,369,000.00 $1,458,274.00 $232.73 7% 1.00 Interfor Pacific, Inc. 
 TEXAS 

 86142 4 ISLANDS Clallam Ol 3185 $506,000.00 $507,510.01 $159.34 0% 1.00 Munro, LLC 
 86392 QUICKDRAW Clark PC 6205 $1,629,000.00 $1,975,013.66 $318.29 21% 3.00 Hampton Tree Farms, Inc. 
 87406 BIG DEAL Clark PC 6562 $1,619,000.00 $2,501,631.00 $381.23 55% 4.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products,  
 LLC. 

 86251 ELECTRIC  Cowlitz, Lewis PC 1242 $276,000.00 NO BIDS 
 CHICKEN  
 HARDWOODS 

 86234 JACKKNIFE Ferry NE 1890 $254,000.00 $401,532.36 $212.45 58% 2.00 Boise Cascade Wood Products,  
 LLC. 

 87516 LOLLY GAGGER  Grays Harbor PC 4101 $1,311,222.37 $1,583,980.88 $386.24 21% 2.77 See Sort Sales Results 
 SORTS 

 86782 PUCKER BRUSH Jefferson Ol 1859 $278,000.00 $451,010.00 $242.61 62% 3.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 86159 * HAMBONE VRH &  Lewis SP 3170 $613,000.00 $790,793.77 $249.46 29% 4.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products,  
 VDT L.P. 

 84231 LUCKY LOUIE Skagit,  NW 2562 $497,000.00 $774,657.00 $302.36 56% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 Snohomish 

 87009 CLEMENTINE Snohomish NW 5052 $1,393,000.00 $1,467,828.65 $290.54 5% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, Inc. 
 87010 REECHO Snohomish NW 3381 $628,000.00 $1,111,956.42 $328.88 77% 1.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 87012 REPERCUSSION Snohomish NW 5730 $1,277,000.00 $1,897,617.00 $331.17 49% 2.00 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 87121 * COPPER RIDGE  Thurston PC 1047 $276,000.00 $432,163.54 $412.76 57% 6.00 Murphy Company 
 2012 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

January 2012 14 13 0 1 52,252 51,010 0 1,242 98% $11,650,222.37 $15,353,968.29 $301.00 32% 2.60 
YTD FY 2012 73 68 0 5 287,658 269,401 0 18,257 94% $73,948,033.73 $88,800,008.27 $329.62 20% 2.58 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 

 January 2012 

      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 87732 STRAITS BIOMASS  Clallam Ol 966 $8,700.00 $10,092.00 $10.45 16% 1.00 Hermann Brothers Logging and  
 2011 Construction, Inc. 

 87285 DUCK WADDELL Thurston PC 1013 $241,000.00 $501,249.42 $494.82 108% 8.00 Murphy Company 

 SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

January 2012 2 2 0 0 1,979 1,979 0 0 100% $249,700.00 $511,341.42 $258.38 105% 4.50 
YTD FY 2012 4 3 0 1 2,585 1,997 0 588 77% $253,700.00 $515,347.42 $258.06 103% 3.33 

 
 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

January 2012 16 15 0 1 54,231 52,989 0 1,242 98% $11,899,922.37 $15,865,309.71 $299.41 33% 2.85 
YTD FY 2012 77 71 0 6 290,243 271,398 0 18,845 94% $74,201,733.73 $89,315,355.69 $329.09 20% 2.61 
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 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES 
 SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 

 January 2012 

 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 87517 LOLLY GAGGER SORT 1 311 $420.10 $458.87 $91,418.20 $103,477.81 $332.73 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 87518 LOLLY GAGGER SORT 2 277 $465.02 $560.00 $74,310.25 $100,620.25 $363.25 3 Rainier Veneer, Inc. 
 87519 LOLLY GAGGER SORT 3 689 $485.01 $496.00 $224,308.95 $231,882.95 $336.55 4 Simpson Lumber Co., LLC 
 87520 LOLLY GAGGER SORT 4 736 $446.01 $541.00 $168,967.52 $238,883.52 $324.57 4 Merrill & Ring Forest Products,  
 L.P. 

 87521 LOLLY GAGGER SORT 5 532 $499.00 $610.00 $186,223.28 $245,273.28 $461.04 5 Murphy Company 
 87522 LOLLY GAGGER SORT 6 1,016 $521.00 $589.00 $383,452.56 $452,536.56 $445.41 5 Murphy Company 
 87523 LOLLY GAGGER SORT 7 21 $388.10 $435.81 $5,517.73 $6,519.73 $310.46 3 Welco Lumber Co., Inc. 
 87524 LOLLY GAGGER SORT 8 91 $400.00 $410.76 $21,712.60 $22,691.76 $249.36 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 87525 LOLLY GAGGER SORT 9 124 $542.50 $564.26 $49,159.84 $51,858.60 $418.21 1 Cascade Hardwoods, Inc. 
 87526 LOLLY GAGGER SORT 10 140 $618.00 $682.00 $64,068.20 $73,028.20 $521.63 2 Northwest Hardwoods 
 87527 LOLLY GAGGER SORT 11 22 $665.00 $725.00 $11,210.54 $12,530.54 $569.57 2 Northwest Hardwoods 
 87528 LOLLY GAGGER SORT 12 21 $665.24 $952.38 $10,618.82 $16,648.80 $792.80 2 Marys River Lumber Co. 
 87529 LOLLY GAGGER SORT 13 121 $267.11 $331.36 $20,253.88 $28,028.88 $231.64 1 JKCK Enterprises, Inc. 
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