

**DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES
BOARD SALE RESULTS**

December 2021

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
100655		SOLDUCKING	Clallam	OLY	4903	\$780,000.00	\$1,276,717.67	\$260.40	64%	2.00	Alta Forest Products, LLC
101293		ABOUT TIME	Grays Harbor	PC	4140	\$1,239,000.00	\$1,264,624.55	\$305.46	2%	2.00	Murphy Company
101103		BLUEHORSE	Grays Harbor, Thurston	SP	4962	\$2,122,000.00	\$2,605,197.29	\$525.03	23%	4.00	Chehalis Valley Timber, Inc.
100664		VEE ARE AITCH	Jefferson	OLY	3165	\$789,000.00	\$1,022,578.07	\$323.09	30%	2.00	Harbor Timber
102022		SHALE CREEK	Jefferson	OLY	5409	\$1,237,000.00	\$1,585,543.00	\$293.13	28%	1.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
100492		POINT BLANK	Lewis	PC	5493	\$2,191,000.00	\$2,935,245.44	\$534.36	34%	3.00	Murphy Company
100995		CAPRA	Thurston	SP	5070	\$1,905,000.00	\$1,958,436.00	\$386.28	3%	2.00	Sierra Pacific Industries
102059		TWO YEARS OUT	Wahkiakum	PC	7716	\$2,546,000.00					NO BIDS

SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
December 2021	8	7	0	1	40,858	33,142	0	7,716	81%	\$10,263,000.00	\$12,648,342.02	\$381.64	23%	2.29
YTD FY 2022	46	43	0	3	197,708	184,835	0	12,873	94%	\$60,929,024.99	\$76,602,415.67	\$414.44	26%	2.66

REGIONAL SALE RESULTS

AGREEMENT	FSC®	NAME OF SALE	COUNTY	REGION	VOLUME OFFERED MBF	MINIMUM BID	BID PRICE	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	# OF BIDS	APPARENT HIGH BIDDER
100662		CENTER 21 THINNING	Clallam, Jefferson	OLY	4747	\$199,000.00	\$707,182.32	\$148.97	255%	2.00	Interfor U.S. Timber, Inc.

SUMMARY OF REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
December 2021	1	1	0	0	4,747	4,747	0	0	100%	\$199,000.00	\$707,182.32	\$148.97	255%	2.00
YTD FY 2022	8	7	0	1	11,961	10,087	0	1,874	84%	\$610,210.00	\$1,378,454.39	\$136.66	126%	2.00

SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES

	SALES OFFERED	SALES SOLD	SALES PENDING	SALES NO BID	VOLUME OFFERED	VOLUME SOLD	VOLUME PENDING	VOLUME NO BID	% VOL SOLD	TOTAL MIN BID SOLD SALES	BID PRICE SOLD SALES	PRICE /MBF	% OVER	AVG # BIDS
December 2021	9	8	0	1	45,605	37,889	0	7,716	83%	\$10,462,000.00	\$13,355,524.34	\$352.49	28%	2.25
YTD FY 2022	54	50	0	4	209,669	194,922	0	14,747	93%	\$61,539,234.99	\$77,980,870.06	\$400.06	27%	2.56

Department of Natural Resources, Information subject to changes and amendments over time

* If marked, all or part of this sale is Forest Stewardship Council® (FSC)-certified (certificate no. BV-FM/COC-080501)

Updated 12/30/2021