
 DEPARTMENT OF NATURAL RESOURCES  
 BOARD SALE RESULTS 
 December 2011 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 84833 DEEP SIX Clallam Ol 4683 $1,299,000.00 $1,341,462.00 $286.45 3% 2.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P. 
 87236 BIG BOE Clallam Ol 3420 $686,000.00 $711,770.00 $208.12 4% 1.00 Interfor Pacific, Inc. 
 85349 COYOTE CREEK Clark PC 6598 $1,704,000.00 $2,188,034.60 $331.62 28% 5.00 High Cascade, Inc. 
 86794 ROCK OUT Clark PC 5813 $1,624,000.00 $2,141,166.00 $368.34 32% 6.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P. 
 85512 SHIP WRECK Cowlitz PC 3663 $1,037,000.00 $1,281,870.00 $349.95 24% 4.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P. 
 87395 SMARTY PANTS Lewis PC 2626 $656,000.00 $671,000.12 $255.52 2% 2.00 Tim Brown Logging, Inc. 
 84699 FINAL DIVIDE Mason SP 1815 $564,000.00 $787,768.00 $434.03 40% 5.00 Merrill & Ring Forest Products, L.P. 
 86721 HUNDRED DAYS Skagit NW 4317 $1,276,000.00 $1,555,965.03 $360.43 22% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, Inc. 
 86034 LOST CAP Snohomish NW 2475 $734,000.00 $819,560.99 $331.14 12% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, Inc. 
 86332 PEAR SORTS Thurston PC 5861 $2,115,806.81 $2,412,264.32 $411.58 14% 2.60 See Sort Sales Results 
 85935 TRAVELIN LIGHT Whatcom NW 4335 $1,246,000.00 $1,518,682.41 $350.33 22% 2.00 Hampton Tree Farms, Inc. 

 SUMMARY OF BOARD SALES 
  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

December 2011 11 11 0 0 45,606 45,606 0 0 100% $12,941,806.81 $15,429,543.47 $338.32 19% 3.05 
YTD FY 2012 61 55 0 6 244,857 218,391 0 26,466 89% $62,297,811.36 $73,446,039.98 $336.31 18% 2.58 
 
 REGIONAL SALE RESULTS 
 December 2011 
      VOLUME       
 AGREEMENT FSC  NAME OF SALE COUNTY REGION OFFERED MINIMUM  BID PRICE % # OF APPARENT 
  MBF BID PRICE /MBF OVER BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

YTD FY 2012 2 1 0 1 606 18 0 588 3% $4,000.00 $4,006.00 $222.56 0% 1.00 
   
 SUMMARY OF ALL BOARD AND REGIONAL SALES 

  SALES SALES SALES SALES VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME VOLUME % VOL TOTAL MIN BID PRICE PRICE % AVG # 
 OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID OFFERED SOLD PENDING NO BID SOLD BID SOLD SALES SOLD SALES /MBF OVER BIDS 

December 2011 11 11 0 0 45,606 45,606 0 0 100% $12,941,806.81 $15,429,543.47 $338.32 19% 3.05 
YTD FY 2012 63 56 0 7 245,463 218,409 0 27,054 89% $62,301,811.36 $73,450,045.98 $336.30 18% 2.55 
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SORT SALE RESULTS (by Sale) 
 December 2011 
 Delivered Values Stumpage Determination (Projected) 
    VOLUME   TOTAL      
 AGREE- FSC NAME OF SALE OFFERED MINIMUM  BID  MINIMUM  TOTAL BID  PRICE # OF APPARENT 
 MENT  MBF BID / MBF PRICE / MBF BID PRICE  /MBF BIDS HIGH BIDDER 

 87376 PEAR SORTS 1 77 $510.39 $540.16 $28,914.55 $31,207.05 $405.29 3 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 87377 PEAR SORTS 2 502 $515.00 $517.00 $190,629.48 $191,633.48 $381.74 3 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 87378 PEAR SORTS 3 1,915 $525.00 $525.01 $724,851.65 $724,865.80 $378.52 2 Simpson Lumber Co., LLC 
 87379 PEAR SORTS 4 1,786 $475.00 $530.37 $547,641.18 $646,532.00 $362.00 3 Stimson Lumber Company 
 87380 PEAR SORTS 5 787 $535.01 $580.00 $307,501.64 $342,911.64 $435.72 3 Olympic Panel Products 
 87381 PEAR SORTS 6 424 $525.00 $635.21 $153,572.80 $200,301.84 $472.41 1 Stimson Lumber Company 
 87382 PEAR SORTS 7 41 $440.00 $440.00 $11,648.10 $11,648.10 $284.10 2 Sierra Pacific Industries 
 87383 PEAR SORTS 8 31 $750.00 $875.00 $18,224.90 $22,099.90 $712.90 3 Welco Lumber Co., Inc. 
 87384 PEAR SORTS 9 63 $270.00 $414.00 $6,225.66 $15,297.66 $242.82 2 Pacific Fibre Products, Inc. 
 87385 PEAR SORTS 10 235 $800.00 $1,222.00 $126,596.85 $225,766.85 $960.71 4 The Oeser Company 
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